AGENDA ITEM SUMMARY.

DATE: 12/17/2012 DEPARTMENT: Administratfion - DEPT. HEAD SIGNATURE: HD

SUBJECT

Werthheimer Park Naming discussion

AUTHORITY: OO ID Code O City Ordinance/Code  Municipal Code

Hailey discussed naming the rodeo grounds area “Werthheimer Park during the November 19, 2012
meeting. Further discussion was scheduled in December, following further distribution of information.

BACKGROUND:

FISCAL IMPACT / PROJECT FINANCIAL ANALYSIS:
Budget Line ltem # YTD Line ltem Balance $

WHEN CLEARING YOUR DRIVE, PUT

i  SNOWINTO.YOUR YARD ‘

| Please be considerate of your neighbors. If
~ aneighbors’ driveway is next to yours,
push or blow the snow into your own yard.
Do not push or plow the snow back into the
roadway, as it may impede emergency ve-
hicle access. City ordinance prohibits plow-
ing snow across or onto any public street,
service access, parking area, alley or side-
walk. '

oz, WHATSHOULDWE |
/#%\ CALLTHE NEW RODEO
GROUNDS?

e

ST.188%

The City wants your input on naming what has fonﬁerly
been referred to as the Hailey Rodeo Park or.Rodeo
Grounds.

Attend the discussion and share your ideas or comment  |§
on the proposed name of “Werthheimer Park™ (the Hailey
man who donated the land back in 1913) or submit

written comments to tom.hellen@haileycityhall.org Calendar
Lo Important dates:
- Public Meeting City COUNCL.....esvverrsene 12/03/12, 12/17/12
December 17th 5:30pm - Hailey Arts Commission.........o...... 12/06/12
Hailey City Hall, 115 Main St. South Hailey Library Board .........ccoc.eeeenns 12/19/12
Call 788-9830, ext. 14 for more information F Parks & Lands -Board ...................... 12/04/12
P&Z Commission......ocevirviseeeneerennnns 12/10/12
Tree Committee. ...ooevverremrvvermrivrennne, 12/13/12
Urban Renewal Agency ......ccoeveuenee. 12/19/12
*Christmas Eve.....cccco....e. SR *12/24/12
* Christmas Day....ccecceevveeeecrernnnns *12/25/12
* New Years Day..c.oceeererererinnnns *01/01/13

*City Hall and Hailey Public Library Cloéed

Our Town - Page 2

-111-



Heather Dawson

Subject: FW: Naming the rodeo grounds "Hailey Rodeo Grounds"

From: Heather Dawson

Sent: Tuesday, December 11, 2012 12:41 PM

To: 'Don Keirn'; Mariel Platt; Fritz Haemerle; pat cooley

Cc: Tom Hellen; Carol Brown; burkefamily203@cox.net; Beth Robrahn; Fritz Haemmerle
Subject: RE: Naming the rodeo grounds "Hailey Rodeo Grounds"

I attended a Chamber of Commerce event today and spoke about the Werthheimer Park naming matter on next
Monday's agenda. | received two comments:

1. Rick Davis suggested the name "Werthheimer Activity Park 2. Krista Goerke favored the historical name,
Werthheimer park.

The Chamber staff will put this question up on their facebook page later today to draw some more comments before
Monday's meeting.

Heather Dawson
Hailey City Administrator

From: Don Keirn [mailto:donidaho@cox.net]

Sent: Tuesday, December 11, 2012 11:21 AM

To: Mariel Platt; Fritz Haemerle; pat cooley

Cc: Tom Hellen; Heather Dawson; Carol Brown; burkefamily203@cox.net; Micah Austin
Subject: Re: Naming the rodeo grounds "Hailey Rodeo Grounds"

I have had the same concerns as Mariel {great minds run in the same direction Mariel!). Micah has been working with
outside agencies to eventually bring some more or less "name" entertainment venues to the arena.

The name ""Hailey Rodeo Grounds" could well be a detractor to some of these groups. We really need to bring in some
substantial, well paying outside business to this facility. |, at least, cannot justify the millions spent on this great
structure for only a couple of rodeos a year. It can be an excellent source of revenue to our city and our businesses.
Don

From: Mariel Platt

Sent: Tuesday, December 11, 2012 9:15 AM

To: Fritz Haemerle ; pat cooley

Cc: Tom Hellen ; Heather Dawson ; Carol Brown ; donidaho@cox.net ; Martha Burke (burkefamily203 @cox.net)
Subject: RE: Naming the rodeo grounds "Hailey Rodeo Grounds"

One thing to consider is whether naming the arena the Hailey Rodeo Grounds will limit the types of events that utilize
the space to rodeos or similar events. If it's named rodeo grounds, will the event organizers perceive the venue to be

1
-112-



somewhat limited to.rodeo activities? Will it be more difficult to solicit proposals for music events or other non-rodeo
activities at this location? I'm not sure, but something to keep in mind.

Mariel Platt AICP LEED(r) AP
Sustainability Coordinator

City of Hailey

(208) 788-9815, ext. 24
Mariel.platt@haileycityhall.org

On Dec 10, 2012, at 8:45 PM, "pat cooley" <pat.cooley@haileycityhall.org>
wrote:.

>Tom,

> | would tend to agree. | like and support the idea of the whole area _
> being the Wirthhiemer park where the Hailey rodeo grounds are Iocated

> As well as the Hailey skate park.

> -----Original Message -----

> From: Bill Brand [mailto: halleyblll@earthlmk net]

> Sent: Monday, December 10, 2012 4:02 PM

>To: Tom Hellen

> Subject: Naming the rodeo grounds "Hailey Rodeo Grounds"

>

> " I've been in rodeos around the U.S. for many years and found that
> local rodeo grounds are mostly referred to by the locality in which
> they're located.

>~ Credits are frequently given to donors by a plague conspicuously
> Iocated on the grounds.

> ' Much better advertising is given to outSIders planning to attend
> events by calling the Grounds "Hailey Rodeo Grounds".

> Diana and Bill Brand

-113-






City of Hailey

MEMORANDUM
TO: Mayor and City Council

FROM: Mariel Platt, Sustainability Coordinator

RE: Build Better Program (BBP) —adoption as a mandatory code
DATE: . December 17, 2012
Notice

Notice for the December 17, 20012 public hearing was published in the Idaho Mountain Express and
mailed to public agencies and area media on November 28, 2012. In addition, a number of state
organizations and agencies including but not limited to the following were notified by email: Idaho
Association of Cities, Idaho Home Builders Association, Wood River Building Contractor’s Association,
Jocal American Institute of Architects on November 28, 2012 and the Sawtooth Board of Realtors were
notified on December 13, 2012. '

Proposal
Amendments to Chapter 15.08 of the Mumc1pa1 Code are proposed by the Clty These amendments

would add a new Section - Section 15.08.012, Build Better Program - creating above-code building

~ standard, amend Section 15.08.020, Amendment of codes and amends Section 15.08.030, Additional
requirements, with an effective date of May 1, 2013. Refer to the attached ordinance for the proposed
language. , '

Procedural History
The following outlines the history of the Buﬂd Better Program (BBP) and other jurisdictions’ programs
(shown in italics) in the area.

September 2008 = Council approved the creation of the Sustainable Building Committee

November 2008 - Sustainable Building Committee began meeting twice a month for 18 months to
research programs and existing codes, conduct education and outreach to the
public, and develop & recommendation for the Council.

April 2010 Council reviewed a presentation of the Sustainable Building Committee’s
recommendation for an above-code building program. During the April review, the
Council instructed staff to 1) draft an ordinance, 2) respond to follow up questions
asked by the Council, and 3) continue education and outreach efforts with the
public.

May 2010 - Staff presented responses to the Council’s questions and continued with education
and outreach efforts, hosting the Build Better, Build Smart Community Series

-115-



May 2010

September 2010

January 2011

May 2011

February 2012

May 2012

Build Better Program
December 17, 2012
Page 2

events on July and August 2010. The Committee met with members or affiliates of
the Hailey Chamber and Rotary and discussed the proposed amendments.

Staff submitted the draft ordinance to a technical review committee assigned by the
U.S. Department of Energy and the State of Idaho, for a thorough review by
building and energy experts. Staff received both groups’ comments and follow up
on questions and further discussion. The BBP incorporates the suggestions and
comments made by the review committees.

Staff presented the ordinance to the Council. At this meetm the Council requested
the following additional information: :
1. Financial evaluation of additional construction costs to comply with the
Build Better Program verses the 2009 IECC.
2. Review of building permit fees to identify potential for reductlons in fees
and compare fees to other jurisdictions.
The Council requested the following changes:
1. Remove new windows from the Build Better Program’s requirement for an
energy analysis (audit).
2. Add language to allow a one year voluntary period.

Council adopted BBP as voluntary for 1 year with subsequent review by the
Council for consideration to mandatory in 2012.

Blaine County adopted a mandatory above code residential program that requires
energy efficiency that is 15-75% more than the current code, depending on home

size.

Council renewed the BBP as voluntary until January 2013, with an additional

. amendment that provided a prescriptive pathway for the energy efficiency

requirements to be met. This amendment was consistent with Ketchum and Blaine
County’s programs, which allow both a prescriptive and performance pathway.

Ketchum adopted National Green Building Standard as a mandatory above code

_ residential program.

Ordinance Formatting

A summary of the proposed amendments and additions to Chapter 15.08, Building Codes, are as follows:

Creates Section 15.08.012, Build Better Program. |
e Adds Applicability (Section 15.08.012.A)
e Adds Definitions (Section 15.08.012.B)
e Adds Energy Efficiency (Section 15.08.012.C)

-116-



Build Better Program
December 17,2012
Page 3

o Adds Water conservation, indoor air quality, construction waste, and durability and
assurance (WICDA) (Section 15.08.012.D)

e Adds Points Menu (Section 15.08.012.E) that pertains to only certain projects and allows
flexible options of sustainable building practices and products to be incorporated into the
project. ‘

Amends Section 15.08.020, Amendment of codes.

e Requires the performance method as a compliance path, not the prescriptive method, for
commercial buildings. Residential buildings have two compliance pathways (performance
using a HERS Rater and prescriptive).

Amends Section 15.08.030, Additional requirements.

s References Section 15.08.012, Build Better Program as a requirement above the 2009 -

IECC.

Administration ,
The Community Development Department will verify and implement the Build Better Program, in the
following manner:.
e Building will administer energy efficiency, Section 15.08.012.C.
e - Building and Planning/Sustainability will administer the water conservation, indoor air
quality, construction waste, and durability and assurance (WICDA), Section 15.08.012.D.
e Planning/Sustainability Department will administer the points menu, Section 15.08.012.E,
excluding parts of Section 15.08.012.E.5 (the energy efﬁc1ency sectlon of the points
menu).

Financial Informatlon

BBP - Residential New Construction

It is difficult to quantify how much energy will be saved and what the costs to build to 10% better than the
2009 IECC would be without modeling the building. In May 2010, Staff called David Neiger from

- Populus Sustainable Design, in Boulder, CO (David presented to the Council and held a community
workshop on REMRATE and HERS last October), to see if he could provide some consulting services for
staff to address the Council’s request. David estimated the time it would take to re-run the software and
quantify the construction costs at about $750 per home, based on his rate of $125/hr. Due to the expense,
in 2010 staff asked Jolyon Sawrey, architect and HERS rater, to do the analysis on a Hailey home that

Jolyon had already modeled and that the C1ty has building permit 1nformat10n on, prior to hiring a
consultant.

Jolyon took an existing REMRATE model of a 1,600 square foot home built in Hailey to the 2009 IECC
and made upgrades to specific components of the building that increase energy efficiency to 10% better
than the 2009 IECC. The design of the home itself and the orientation was not changed. This is important -
to note, because studies have shown that strategic placement of window and building orientation alone can
increase energy efficiency up to 25%. This home was not designed with this in mind. The uporades "
included the following (see attached chart for the financial description):

e Increase U-value of windows

e Increased ductwork air sealing

e Increased attic, wall, stem wall, and rim of floor 1nsu1at10n r-value

-117-



Build Better Program
December 17, 2012
Page 4

e Increased lighting to 50% CFL
o Increased furnace to 94% efficiency

Jolyon estimated the additional expenses associated with each of these upgrades and reported the yearly
energy savings calculated by REMRATE. The information resulted in the following evaluation conducted
by staff:

Cost increase: 0.4% ($1,220) compared to 2009 IECC, based on the 2009 IECC cost of construction for
this particular home estimated at $300,000 (this figure includes HERS rater fees).

Annual energy costs for home built to 2009 IECC: $1,395

Annual energy savings (built 10% more efficient): $139.50

5 year savings: $697.50

50 year savings: $7,000 (assuming today’s energy costs stay constant)

Simple payback: 8.7 years

If the Council wishes, staff could contract with Populus Sustainable Design to provide further evaluation
using houses of varying sizes.

Up Front Costs - General Overview of Various Green Building Programs

To date there has been a widespread perception that green buildings are substantially more costly than
conventional design. This perception has been the single largest obstacle to more widespread adoption of
green design. While it is difficult to determine the exact upfront costs of the committee’s recommendation
(10% increase in energy efficiency for new construction), it is not impossible. There are many examples of
national programs, such as LEED, that have been replicated all over the U.S. Theses national programs
require much more than a 10% better energy performance and significant green improvements to water
conservation, materials and resources, waste management, site suitability, durability and assurance, indoor
air quality, etc. Many studies have been conducted on these existing programs that have quantified the
upfront costs. From the results of existing data on upfront costs, the upfront costs for a 10% increase in
energy efficiency (the committee’s recommendation) can be inferred.

The following references are taken from study results of upfront costs for new construction of various
“green” certified buildings. A table summary is listed below.

“Studies found that an increase in energy efficiency of 32-40% better than code can be accomplished at
an increase of less than 1% in construction cost, with a simple payback of 4.5 years” (New York State
Energy Research and Development Authority).

“ Studies by the Department of Energy’s National Renewable Energy Laboratory (NREL) illustrate that
meeting a 30% residential energy consumption reduction target below the baseline-energy code will save
households in every region of the U.S. between $403 and $612 per year after the cost of efficiency
measures is factored in” (U.S. Department of Energy).

Research conducted by Sustainabl4 Built, LLC of Boulder, indicates a HERS score of 60 (40% more
energy efficient than code), increases the upfront cost by 1.75 % ! (Sustainable Built, LLC).

! Complying with Boulders Energy Codes — 3 Paths to Reach HERS 70, 60, 35, 10
(http://www.sustainablybuilt.com/content/complying-boulder-energy-codes—0)

-118-



Build Better Program
December 17,2012
Page 5

A 15% increase in energy efficiency has an average upfront cost of 0-1% and will save $§496 a year in
heating and cooling energy cost (Kentucky Office of Energy Policy).

A study comparing LEED buildings across the U.S. to conventional designs for the same buildings
showed that an 18% increase in energy efficiency (LEED Certified) had an up front cost of 0.66%, a 30%
increase in energy efficiency (LEED Silver) had a 2.11% increase in upfront costs, and a 37% increase in
energy efficiency (LEED Gold) had a 1.82% increase in upﬁ*om‘ costs (Greg Kats, Green Building Costs
and Financial Benefits, 2003).

By implemenz‘zng passive solar design concepts alone heating and cooling loads can be reduced by 10-
15%, which requires no additional up front cost, only proper building orientation and window placement
(Energy Efficiency in Buildings — Summary Reporz‘ World Business Council for Susmmable
Development).

“The energy demand for new office buildings can be reduced by 50% for compared to the exzsz‘zng
building stock without increasing construction costs (qunhofer Institute).

The cost to achieve LEED certification is between 0% to 3% of additional costs (Energy Efficiency in
Buildings — Summary Report, World Business Council for Sustainable Development).

An Atlanta community found that for an additional $500 in up ﬁ'ont costs increased the energy effi czency
by 40% in aﬁ‘ordable homes (U.S. Department of Energy).

Window orientation, which has no addmonal up front costs, can increase energy efficiency up to 25% for
some designs (U.S. Department of Energy).

By properly sealing air leakages a 30% increase in energy efficiency can occur, which typically costs less
than $200 for the average home (U.S. Department of Energy).

201 Green Bulldmg Costs and_
r 1al Beneﬁts Greg Kats

-119-



Build Better Program
December 17, 2012
Page 6

LEED. . 18%-37% . 0-3% " World Business Council for
G P T R T ' ... ‘Sustainable Development ‘.

Points Menu

The points menu applies to new residential construction, some residential additions greater than 500 sq. ft.
of conditioned space, and exterior snowmelt systems. The number of points is based on the square footage
of conditioned space and the number of bedrooms or just the square footage in the case of showmelt
systems. The impetus for the creation of the points menu is to create a flexible approach that gives
numerous options to choose from in an effort to off-set the amount of resources required for larger homes
and additions. It attempts to encourage smaller, more efficient homes and additions based on the fact that
the larger the home the greater the amount of energy and resources are consumed. Therefore, more points
or greater sustainable practices and materials would be required.

Staff has re-reviewed the points menu to determine which points and how many points could be obtained
for little to no additional cost. In some cases, a contractor could save money. Staff identified point options
that were thought to have little to no additional cost. Staff did not price out each point option in'the points
menu, due to the time required to contact manufactures, installers, and contractors. It is estimated based
on staff research that 31 points can be obtained with no additional cost. Another 11 points can be obtained
for less than $100 a point. Thirty-one (31) of the following 39 points can be obtained for no additional
cost:

Reuse Existing Building: Up to S points.

Point | Percent of Exterior Walls saved
s (external sheathing and framing)
3 50%
5 75%
New Construction Waste Recycling: Up to 3 points.
i) Application: points will be awarded according to the following table:
Points | Percéntage Waste Percentage Diverted
1 . 75% 25%
2 50% 50%
3 25% 75%

Passive Cooling: 2 to 5 points.
1) Application: Any combination of natural cooling techniques can be used to reduce
overheating in homes. Use awnings and window overhangs primarily on south-facing glass to provide a
balance between summer cooling and winter heating through solar gain. Points will be awarded for
passive cooling systems using any two or more of these techniques (one point per option):
D Exterior vertical shading devices for east- and west-facing glass.

-120~-



Build Better Program
December 17, 2012
Page 7

(2)  Low emissivity films on glass on east- and west-facing windows.

(3) - Radiant barriers installed in the attic space.

(4)  Landscaping that shades east- and west-facing windows during the cooling
season (June to September).

(5) South window overhang sized to effectively shade the window (from June
to September).

Energy Efficient Appliances: Up to 6 pomts

. (1) Application: points will be awarded for ENERGY STAR appliances
according to the following:

Point | Type of ENERGY STAR rated appliance

Refrigerator

Clothes washer

Freezer, not part of refrigerator apphance
Dishwasher

— = NN |»

Advanced Framing Techniques: 2 to 10 points.
1) Verification: Checked during plans review and a‘V‘eriﬁcation of
: Accountablhty by Responsible Party form shall be submitted, before the final mspectlon
C D) 24-inch On-Center Framing: 2 points.
ili)  Resource Efficient Insulated Headers: 2 points.
(1)  Application: points are awarded for incorporating a minimum R-10

insulation in the header section '

1v) Trusses with energy heel: 2 points.

V) HVAC Ducts Within Conditioned Spaces: 2 pomts

vi) Minimum 24-inch Roof Overhangs: 2 points.

Environmentally Preferred, Low Emission, and Local Materials: Up to 10 points from Chart
A. ' v
i) . Application: For each assembly, all product specification type requirements
shall be met in order to receive the points available. Environmentally preferred and low emission
qualifying products have more than one of these attributes: recycled content, reclaimed, bjo-based,
agricultural residue, rapidly renewable, and low or no volatile organic compounds (VOCs) emissions. A
“recycled content” product must contain a minimum of 25 percent post-consumer recycled content except
as noted otherwise above. Post-industrial (pre-consumer) recycled content is counted at half the rate of
post-consumer content. Except as otherwise noted in Chart A, 90 percent of the component, by weight or
volume, must meet the specification shown. Locally sourced materials are products that are manufactured
within 500 miles of the city are considered local. (For more details on these points refer to Chart A in the

-121-



Build Better Program
December 17, 2012
Page 8

Points Menu section of the attached ordinance)

Reduction in Building Permit Fees

Due to the HERS rater providing verification with the building permit plans submittal and certificate of
occupancy request as well as conducting inspections during the interim, the Building Department would
no longer inspect the plans for energy code compliance for new residential construction that chose to
pursue the performance pathway to show compliance. In 2010, the Building Department estimated that
approximately 50% of the time spent on building permits for new residential construction was dedicated
to energy code compliance. With the HERS rater providing this service, the building permit fee could be
reduced by 50%. For a $300,000 home, this equates to a $1,500 reduction, approximately. HERS rater
fees for new construction is estimated to cost $1,000 to $1,500. This fee reduction was used by the three
(3) BBP voluntary projects that are currently being constructed.

Activity Since 2011
During the past 24 month voluntary period, I have met with 2 number of individuals and have the
collected the following feedback and information:

1. Three Hailey building permit applicants have committed to participating in the program. To date
none of these projects have been corpleted; however, the city can glean a limited amount of
information from the projects and the experience of the applicants to help guide the Council in
their future decision to consider the BBP for adoption as a mandatory code.-

2. Blaine County adopted a similar mandatory program in May 2011 and has processed a number of
applications that have complied with the County’s new reqmrements which provides Hailey with
valuable information.

3. The City of Ketchum adopted a mandatory above-code building program for residential
construction May 2012, with hearings on their commercial code to begin shortly.

Each of these occurrences is further elaborated on below.

1. Hailey BBP Participants
Blake Eagle is building a new residential construction project and is nearing completion. His general
comments, taken from February 2012, are as follows:

o “baby steps” are appropriate,

s Hailey, Ketchum, and County codes should as unified as possible,

e greater financial incentives should be available to help off-set costs, and

e  during his comments to the Council at the February 2012 meeting he stated he was in

support of the BBP. '

He was partlcularly interested in seeing DIF reduced or defetred as an offered incentive. The participant is
already receiving a 50% reduction in building permit and review fees, which is currently only allowed for
residential, new construction that pursues the performance pathway using a HERS Rater. The rationale
behind this reduction is that a 3™ party HERS (Home Energy Rating System) rater is now modeling the
plans and submitting a HERS score with the building permit plans to verify proposed energy efficiency
and energy code compliance and conducting the field verification and post construction HERS scores to
verify compliance. The building department’s time conducting energy code compliance at permit review
and during field inspections has been estimated at half of the total review and inspection time.

-122-



Build Better Program
December 17, 2012
Page 9

Tom Held has completed the framing on his new construction residential project. His HERS score is 64.
Staff spoke to Held on December 13, 2012. His comments are as follows:

o Itisn’ta steep learning curve

e It’s just an extra step, like adapting to any new code.

¢ The BBP is rational and is easier than Ketchum’s program.

o The up- front costs are incidental. A better job of caulking can help reduce air infiltration
to achieve a better HERS score (10% or better energy efficiency increase). Those costs are
estimated to be two $25 cans of foam and a few hours of labor, which equate to
approximately $100. ‘ ,

¢ No problems with making it mandatory, but does not want to see Hailey go to Ketchum’s
code, due to his perception that it is more difficult.

Thad Farnham has almost completed his new construction residential project. It is expected to receivea .
HERS score of 41, which far exceeds the requirement of HERS 72. Staff spoke with him on December 13,
2012. His comments were as follows:
: e The BBP is well thought out and crafted.
e Itis easily attainable.
e The points for new residential construction are easy to achieve.
o It is good that there is a prescriptive-and performance pathway and both are easily
achievable. ‘
o He hopes that the community becomes more aware of HERS scores and that consumers
begin to use it as a tool to better understand home performance.

2. Blaine County’s Experience'with a Mandatory Code _
Bill Dyer, the County’s Building Official, has been implementing the County’s Buildsmart regulations for -
since May 2011. Bill has found that there is additional time required when processing building permits, to
explain to the public what the new requirements are. He said there are a number of projects that are
exempt from Buildsmart, but the owners and/or builders are choosing to go forward with the testing
protocol provided by a HERS rater to verify whole house air sealing with a blower door test (this is the
same testing used in Hailey’s BBP) and to identify what the project’s HERS score is. Some permit for a
new single family residence have elected to pursue the National Green Building Standard’s (INGBS)
emerald target, in-lieu of the Buildsmart requirements. Overall, Bill has indicated that there have been no
major issues with the new code and no changes have been deemed necessary since Buildsmart’s adoption.

* In February 2012 staff spoke with John Reuter, a local HERS rater. At the time he had worked as the 3™
party verify for more than seven (7) projects that fell under the Buildsmart program requirements. He has
found that a number of County projects easily achieve the requirement. However, a few have not, -
especially the larger projects, such as a 7,000 sq. ft. home that requires a HERS score of 48 due to the-
County’s requirements for larger homes. In explaining Hailey’s program to John, he expressed to me that
he is a builder’s advocate and is choosing not to advocate mandatory programs; however, he felt, based on
the projects he has worked on that 10% better than the current code (BBP energy requirement), was not
difficult or expensive to achieve.

-123-



3. City of Ketchum’s Mandatory Code

Build Better Program
December 17, 2012
Page 10

Ketchum recently adopted NGBS for their mandatory residential code. NGBS is considered a
comprehensive green building code; similar to LEED, it addresses indoor air quality, waste management,
energy efficiency, water conservation, etc. NGBS is an allowable exemption of Hailey’s BBP. LEED is an
exemption in both Hailey voluntary code and Ketchum and the County’s mandatory code. Ketchum will
has been reviewing a mandatory commercial code. Ketchum’s code offers a prescriptive and performance
path; however even the prescriptive path requires a blower door test to identify air leaks in the building
and verify quality construction. Ketchum staff, who worked on the proposed code, has stated that in the
public workshops and hearings NGBS has been well received by the community. Ketchiim staff estimate a
2-6% upfront cost increase and stated that NGBS is easier to achieve, cheaper to certify, and costs
approximately 1/3 of the total cost when compared to LEED.

COMPARISON CHART

Hailey — Build Better

Ketchum - NGBS

Blaine County — Build

- Program Smart

Types of buildings Residential and Residential with - Residential

Commercial Commercial to follow

: | shortly _
Status Voluntary: = -~ - - -+ | Mandatory -~ - - - Mandatory .
Applicable 500 sg. ft. Over 300 sq. ft. of 25% of the structures
Remodels/Renovations \ conditioned space interior or exterior
membrane is removed.
Applicable Additions 500 sq. ft. Over 300 sq. ft. of 301 sq. ft. '
conditioned space ‘

Energy Requirement 10% better than the Points based, but must 15-75% better than 2009

2009 IECC be better than 2009 IECC, depending on

1IECC. building size

Other Requirements Points based water Points based water No

conservation, waste conservation; waste

| management, indoor air | management, indoor air

quality and materials quality and materials

management/selection | management/selection
Outdoor Energy Voluntarily regulates Regulates pools, spas, Regulates pools, spas,
Conservation snowmelt snowmelt ' snowmelt

LEED and NGBS LEED LEED and NGBS

Excepted alternatives

Summal_y‘

The Council should review the proposed ordinance amendment and approve, deny, or modify the

amendment.

- If the proposed change is apf)roved, the Council is required to pass an ordinance making said arhendment
part of Hailey Municipal Code. The draft ordinance is attached. '

Motion Language

-124-




Build Better Program
December 17, 2012

Page 11
Approval: ‘
Motion to approve the proposed amendments to Chapter 15.08, adopting Ordinance and authorize
the mayor to conduct the first reading by title only.
Denial: ' ' 2
Motion to deny the proposed amendments to Chapter 15.08, finding that [the

Council should state reasons why the amendment is denied].

Continuation: ‘
Motion to continue the public hearing upon the proposed amendment to Chapter 15.08 to

[the Council should specify a date].

-125-



i21194g

(spojg 4d1)  TZ-Y
TZ-4 01 0}400}}40
wel80id S|jem widls uolle|nsui
jo anieA W
-y aseasu] aseany)

piing

a8eyes)

np ui
uoyonpad
fouspyje Tz-¥01  05H 0l  %STEI0) No8Y2S3Y
142 %05 %¥6 uonejnsul co_am_smc_. 3uijess He ¢' 01 anjea $994 pue 31ssl
031 3upysip o1 adeudny jlem ole SMOMIINP ) MOPUIM  JIWiRd Jsiselg
seaiou|  9SEaJoU] SSesou]  dseasou]  paseasou] eseasoul  Buipling 1Nna

S43IH 2031 600¢
X 4 0

UuoIildnNlsuo) jelluapisay Map - weidoid 191109 pling

00s
000t

004T

- 0007

)

$

(

005¢

- 000¢€

- 00S€E

- 000V

- 00SY

51507

-126-



HAILEY ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF HAILEY AMENDING HAILEY MUNICIPAL CODE,
CHAPTER 15.08, BUILDING CODE ORDINANCE, BY ADOPTING A NEW SECTION
15.08.012, BUILD BETTER PROGRAM, WHICH INCREASES ENERGY CONSERVATION
AND PROMOTES SUSTAINABLE BUILDING PRACTICES; BY AMENDING SECTION
15.08.030 TO CREATE ADDITIONAL REQUIREMENTS FOR INCREASED ENERGY
EFFICIENCY AND SUSTAINABLE BUILDING PRACTICES; BY PROVIDING FOR A
SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; BY PROVIDING FOR A REPEALER CLAUSE; AND BY
PROVIDING AN EFFECTIVE DATE.

WHEREAS, Idaho Code § 30-4116 allows the City of Hailey to amend the 2009 TECC to
reflect local conditions, provided the amendments provide an equivalent level of protection;

WHEREAS, the adoption of the Build Better Program will conserve energy, water and
other natural resources and preserve the health of our environment through requirements related to
design, construction, operations, recycling, and thereby promotes the public health, safety, and
welfare; '

WHEREAS, buildings use the most energy of any sector in the US - more than the
transportation sector - therefore; it makes sense to curtail impact where they are greatest;

WHEREAS, Hailey’s climate requires significant amounts of energy to heat during the
winter months, which translates to higher energy costs and prov1des an opportumty to
substantially increase efficiencies and savings;

WHEREAS, the average life span of a building is 75 years and during this time the status
of energy prices and availability could change, especially considering the potential impacts of
climate change and future policies aimed at curtailing emissions associated with climate change;

WHEREAS, the City of Hailey has previously enacted Hailey Ordinance Nos. 1074 and
1105 which established a voluntary Better Build Program and has determined that the Better Build
Program has not been an obstacle for new construction or for remodels; and ‘

WHEREAS, the Hailey City Council finds that the adoption of the Better Build Program
in Section 15.08.012 of the Hailey Municipal Code is in the best interests of the citizens of Hailey
and will promote the health, safety and general welfare of the citizens of Hailey.

NOW, THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL OF THE
CITY OF HAILEY, IDAHO; AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Section 15.08.012, of the Hailey Municipal .Code, Build Better Program, is created by
the addition of the following language: '

A. Apphcablhg This Section 15.08.012 is a supplement to the other adopted
International Codes and is not intended to be used as independent construction regulations or to

-127~



abridge or supersede safety, health or environmental requirements under other applicable codes or
ordinances. All commercial and residential New Construction, Additions, Repairs and Alterations
shall comply with the standards of Section 15.08.012, unless otherwise stated herein.

1. Referenced Codes and Standards. It is the expressed intent of this section to
require higher minimum standards relating to Building performance than the corresponding
minimum standards set by the referenced codes and standards, and in such cases, the higher
minimum standards of this section shall take precedence.

2. Other Laws and Codes. The provisions of this chapter shall not be deemed
to nullify any provisions of local, state or federal laws and codes.
3. Residential New Construction Exemptions. U.S. Green Building Council’s

Leadership in Energy and Environmental Design for Homes certification level or National
Association of Home Builder’s Green Building Program bronze level project are exempt from the
Build Better Program requirements. Either exemption must verify that the project is 10% more
. energy efficient than the IECC, using a HERS Index or the alternative method described in
Section C.1.a.ii. of this Ordinance. The exemptions listed above must show intent to meet the
requirements at the Building Permit review stage through plans and an initial HERS score based
on the proposed design. Prior to receiving a certificate of occupancy, copies of all program
‘documentation and a final HERS score shall be submitted to the Building Department.

4. Commercial New Construction Exemptions. U.S. Green Building Council’s
Leadership in Energy and Environmental Design for New Construction minimum certification
level projects are exempt from the Build Better Program requirements, provided the applicant
verifies that the project meets the minimum energy efficiency requirements for Commercial
Buildings, as identified in Section 15.08.012.C.2.a of the Hailey Municipal Code. The applicant
must identify the intent to meet U.S. Green Building Council’s Leadership in Energy and
Environmental Design for New Construction certification level, at a minimum, at the Building
Permit review stage with an indication on the plans and with a written narrative what Leadership
in Energy and Environmental Design points will be achieved. Prior to receiving a certificate of
occupancy, copies of all program documentation shall be submitted to the Building Department.

5. Exemptions for Commercial and Residential Alterations and Additions. In
Addition to the exemptions listed in Section 101.4 of the IECC, the following projects are exempt
from Section 15.08.012:

a. Window frame and glass replacements of the same size and

location. :
b, Bathroom remodel projects limited to the replacement of

fixtures and cabinets. ‘

c. ‘Kitchen remodel projects limited to the replacement of |
cabinets, counter tops, plumbing fixtures, and appliances. :

d. Electrical work associated with perm1ts issued only for
electrical work : :

e. Plumbing associated with permits issued only for plu:mbing

f. Replacement of HVAC apphances associated with permits
issued only for appliance replacement. -

g. Reroofs.

h. Additions less than 500 square feet of Conditioned Floor

Area.

-128-



1. New construction or Additions of any size that do not include
any Conditioned Floor Area.

]- Alterations that do not affect the integrity of the Building
envelope. ' _

k. Alterations that do not require a Building Permit.

L Tenant and ADA improvements required by the Building
Department. . ’

m. Structures listed on the National Historic Register.

' B. Definitions. For the purpose of this Section 15.18.012, the following capitalized
words and phrases shall apply as defined herein, in addition to definitions found in Chapter 2 of
the IECC.

“Program Administrators” shall mean city staff from the Building and Planning
Departments who admlmster Section 15.08.012 of the Hailey Municipal Code, the Build Better
Program.

“Certified HERS Rater” shall mean a Home Energy Rating System provider who has
current and valid certification under Residential Energy Services Network (RESNET) and who
adheres to the RESNET defined standards of practice and code of ethics.

“Compact fluorescent light bulb” or “CFL” shall mean a fluorescent light bulb that has
been compressed into the size of a standard-issue incandescent light bulb, known for its long life
span and superior energy efficiency when compared to incandescent lights.

“COMcheck Energy Analysis” shall mean a software used to verify commercial code
. compliance and above code requirements with the IECC.

“EnergyPlus” shall mean software used to evaluate and analyze buﬂdlng energy
performance.

“ENERGY STAR Advanced Lighting Package” or “(ALP)” shall mean an ENERGY

STAR Certified Home that includes a comprehensive set of ENERGY STAR qualified light
fixtures that at a minimum consist of 60% ENERGY STAR qualified hard-wired fixtures and
100% ENERGY STAR qualified ceiling fans where installed. :

“ENERGY STAR Builder” shall mean a builder who has completed ENERGY STAR’s
Partnership Agreement, has selected a Home Energy Rater, and who is listed on the ENERGY
STAR website as an ENERGY STAR partner.

“ENERGY STAR Indoor airPLUS” or “IAP” shall mean an ENERGY STAR Certified
Home that includes a number of construction practices and technologies to decrease the risk of
poor indoor air quality, including careful selection and installation of moisture control systems,
heating, cooling, and ventilation (HVAC) equipment, combustion venting systems, and building
materials. that are tested and verified by an independent party. '

“ENERGY STAR Northwest Program” shall mean an independently tested and verified
home energy certification program that ensures homes are built 15% more energy efficient
compared to current code building homes.

‘ “EQuest” shall mean a software used to evaluate and analyze building energy
performance.

“Forest Stewardship Council Certified” or “FSC Certified” shall mean a label that verifies
a chain of custody certification that wood that has been grown in a manner that meets the FSC’s
sustainable forestry practices and standards.

-129-



“Home Energy Rating System Audit” or “HERS Audit” shall mean a comprehensive
visual and technical energy analysis of a home using Residential Energy Services Network’s
(RESNET) protocol and a REM/Rate™ Energy Analysis and includes a prioritized list of
suggested improvements and their associated energy and financial savings. At a minimum, the
audit evaluates the following, to determining the rating of the home: blower door test, duct blaster
test (if applicable), an inventory of the lighting, appliances, insulation, solar orientation, and
heating and cooling equipment.

“Home Energy Rating System Index” or “HERS Index” shall mean a scoring system
established by the Residential Energy Services Network (RESNET) in which a home built to the
specifications of the HERS Reference Home scores a HERS Index of 100, while a net zero energy
home scores a HERS Index of 0. The lower a home's HERS Index, the more energy efficient it is
in comparison to the HERS Reference Home. ~

“Light Emitting Diode” or “LED” shall mean an electronic device that emits light when an
electrical current is passed through it, known for its long life span and superior energy efficiency
when compared to incandescent lights.

“Leadership in Energy and Environmental Design Accredited Professional” or “LEED
AP” shall mean a person who has successfully passed a test on the LEED process, points, and
documentation requirements, in accordance with the US Green Building Council’s specifications

“Minimum Efficiency Reporting Value” or “MERV” shall mean a rating method used for
comparing the efficiency of an air filter; the higher the MERYV rating, the better the filter is at
removing particles from the air. ,

- -“National Association of Home Builder’s Green Building Program” shall mean a program
based on the International Code Council 700-2008 National Green Building Standard™ and is a
3" party tested and verified green building program. ,

“Natural Air Changes Per Hour” or “NACH?” shall mean the natural movement of the total
volume of air in a given space that is exchanged over a period of one hour, measured using a
blower door test at 50 Pascal.

“New Construction” shall mean any building with less than 50% of its exterior walls and
foundation remaining or that is being built on a vacant building envelope, where no previously
built structure exists at the time of building. ‘

“REM/Rate™ Energy Analysis” shall mean a residential code compliance and rating
software developed specifically for the needs of HERS raters, that calculates heating, cooling, hot
water, lighting, and appliance energy loads, consumption and costs for new and existing single
and multi-family homes. ' , '

“REScheck Energy Analysis” shall mean a software used to verify residential code
compliance and above code requirements with the IECC.

“Residential Energy Services Network™ or “RESNET” shall mean an industry not-for-
profit membership corporation that is the national standards making body for building energy
efficiency rating systems. : : ‘

“Structural Insulated Panels” shall mean a high performance building panels used in
floors, walls, and roofs for residential and light commercial buildings. The panels are typically
made by sandwiching a core of rigid foam plastic insulation between two structural skins of
oriented strand board (OSB).

“1J.S. Green Building Council’s Leadership in Energy and Environmental Design for
Homes” or “LEED for Homes™ shall mean a consensus-developed, third party-verified, voluntary
rating system which promotes the design and construction of high-performance green homes.

-130~-



“J.S. Green Building Council’s Leadership in Energy and Environmental Design for New
“Construction” or “LEED for New Construction” shall mean a rating system designed to guide and
distinguish high-performance commercial and institutional projects, including office buildings,
high-rise residential buildings, government buildings, recreational facilities, manufacturing plants
and laboratories. ‘
~ “Verification of Accountability by Responsible Party” shall mean a form furnished by the
Program Administrators for the use of verifying, by the Building owner, contractor, or other
responsible party, that points have been met in accordance with the requirements of Section
15.08.012.E, Points Menu.
“WaterSense Program” shall mean a water conservation program with oversight by the
U.S. Environmental Protection Agency that requires all toilets, urinals, faucets, showerheads, and
other products labeled under the program to undergo independent 3™ party testing to ensure that
water conservation is at least 20% greater than conventional items in the respective category.
* “Whole House Fan” shall mean a type of fan installed in a building's ceiling, designed to
. pull hot air out of the building and increase building cooling. o '

“Zoned Hydronic Radiant Heating” shall mean a heating system using a boiler to heat
water and a pump to circulate hot water through radiant floor panels, wall radiators, or baseboard
convectors. The pipes, embedded in the floor, carry heated water that conduct warmth to the
surface where it broadcasts energy to separated radiant heat zones, which are controlled a
thermostat and served by a manifold which distributes the flow of warm water to the individual
circuits of tubing within each zone.

- C. Energy Efficiency. All co’mmerciél and residential New Construction and .
Additions shall comply with the IECC, and shall increase energy efficiency 10% beyond the IECC -
requirements.

, 1. Residential Energy Efficiency. Energy Efficiency shall be 10% greater than
* the TECC requirements for New Construction, Additions, and Alterations with Conditioned Space,
500 square feet or greater. : ’ ‘ ‘ '
a. New Construction. Energy efficiency shall be verified by a
' RESNET Certified HERS Rater using 2 REM/RATE™ Energy Analysis and IECC Section 405
criteria, unless specified herein. Applicants shall submit an initial HERS Index score-based on the
proposed design with a Building Permit application. Prior to receiving a certificate of occupancy,
a final HERS Index score shall be submitted to the Building Department, verifying that both
“project is 10% more energy efficient compared to the IECC.
i) New residential construction certified under the current
ENERGY STAR Northwest Program is exempt from Section 15.08.012.C.1, providing the
Building plans and the constructed building are certified ENERGY STAR Northwest.

_ ii) New residential construction is not required to be
verified by a HERS Rater if they install a 90% AFUE furnace or equivalent system; a 0.62 EF
water heater or equivalent system, all lights are LED or CFL, and air sealing tests verify 5 air
exchanges per hour at 50 Pascals.

b. Additions. A RESNET Certified HERS Rater shall conduct a
Certified HERS Audit of the entire Building associated with the Addition, unless a previous
Certified HERS Audit has been conducted and submitted to the Building Department within the
Jast 5 years. The energy efficiency of the Addition itself shall be verified by a REScheck Energy
Analysis. Applicants shall submit a REScheck Energy Analysis based on the proposed design

_131._



with a Building Permit application. Prior to receiving a certificate of occupancy, the
specifications of the REScheck Energy Analysis will be verified by the Building Department
during routine inspections. The REScheck Energy Analysis shall project a 10% more energy
efficient design compared to the IECC.

C. Alterations. All Alterations that require a Building Permit and affect
the Building envelope are required to conduct a Certified HERS Audit by a RESNET Certified
HERS Rater of the entire Building associated with the Alteration, unless a previous Certified
HERS Audit has been conducted and submitted to the Building Department within the last 5
years. A REScheck Energy Analysis shall be submitted to the Building Department verifying that
the Alteration exceeds the energy efficiency requirements of the IECC by 10% or by calculating
the energy efficiency rating of a specific component that affects energy efficiency associated with
the alteration. For example: the IECC requires a U-factor of 0.3 for a new window installation. A
new window that is 10% more efficient would have a U-factor of 0.27 or better. ‘

i)  Any window installation is not required to conduct a Certified
HERS Audit. - '
2. Commercial Energy Efficiency.

a. New Construction. Buildings less than 10,000 square feet of
Conditioned Space shall verify energy efficiency using a COMcheck Energy Analysis and
Buildings 10,000 square feet or larger shall verify energy efficiency using an energy model.

i) Buildings under 10,000 square feet of Conditioned Space.
Applicants shall submit a COMcheck Energy Analysis based on the proposed design with a
Building Permit application. Prior to receiving a certificate of occupancy, the specifications of the
COMcheck Energy Analysis will be verified by the Building Department during routine
inspections. The COMcheck Energy Analysis shall project a 10% more energy efficient design
compared to the IECC.

ii) Buildings 10,000 square feet of Conditioned Space or larger
shall be energy modeled by a licensed engineer using Building Department Approved energy
modeling software. Approved software includes, but is not limited to, the most recently published
version of the following: eQuest, Trace, Carrier HAP, and EnergyPlus. The model shall verify that
amount of energy used is 10% more energy efficient compared to the IECC and shall be submitted
to the Building Department with the Building Permit application. Prior to receiving a certificate of
occupancy, the specifications of the energy model will be verified by the Building Department -
during routine inspections. , _

b. Additions. An energy audit shall be conducted by an Idaho licensed
engineer on the entire Building associated with the Addition, unless an energy audit by an Idaho
licensed engineer has be conducted and submitted to the Building Department within the last 5
years. Energy efficiency shall be verified by a COMcheck Energy Analysis. Applicants shall
submit a COMcheck Energy Analysis based on the proposed design with a Building Permit
application. Prior to receiving a certificate of occupancy, the specifications of the COMcheck
Energy Analysis will be verified by the Building Department during routine inspections. The
COMcheck Energy Analysis shall project a 10% more energy efficient design compared to the
IECC.

C. Alterations. An energy audit shall be conducted by an Idaho
licensed engineer on the entire Building associated with the Addition, unless an energy audit by
an Idaho licensed engineer has be conducted and submitted to the Building Department within the
last 5 years. A COMcheck Energy Analysis shall be submitted to the Building Department

-132-



verifying that the Alteration exceeds the energy efficiency requirements of the IECC by 10% or
by calculating the energy efficiency rating of a specific component that affects energy efficiency
associated with the alteration. For example: the IECC requires a U-factor of 0.3 for a new window
installation. A new window that is 10% more efficient shall have a U-factor of 0.27 or better.

i) Any window installation is not required to conduct an Audit.

D. Water, Indoor Air. Construction Waste. Durability and Assurance (WICDA). The
provisions of WICDA apply to new residential and commercial construction.
1. Water Conservation. All faucets, showerheads, and toilets installed in a
Building for domestic use and restroom facilities, shall use 20% less water than standard fixtures
or be labeled by the WaterSense Program, which use at least 20% less water than standard
fixtures. Water Sense labels or equivalent documentation shall be submitted to the Building
Department or provided during final inspection for verification.

2. Indoor Air. The applicable sections of the most recent edition of the
International Mechanical Code shall be met to ensure proper ventilation.
3. Construction Waste. In Addition to waste receptacles, bins for cardboard

and clean wood waste shall be provided and sorted accordingly on-site during construction and
will be verified by the Program Administrators during regularly scheduled inspections.

4. Durability and Assurance. Details and specifications shall be submitted in
the drawings, details, or in packet form with the Building Permit in order to promote durability,
and high performance of the Building enclosure and its components and systems through
appropriate design, materials, selection, and construction practices.

a. Under the following categories, the Program Administrators shall
specify What items shall be applicable and provide a list of these items with the Building Permit:
1) Foundations
i1) Walls
iii)  Roofs
iv) Air infiltration
V) Heat loss
b. Before the issuance of a certificate of occupancy, applicants shall

signa declaratlon that states all items are installed to manufacture’s specifications and plan
details. '

E. Points Menu. Unless a qualifying exemption applies, the following construction
activities: exterior snow melt systems, residential New Construction, and residential Additions of
500 square feet of Conditioned Space or greater, shall obtain points from Sections (4) though (11)
- herein, in an amount determined by the applicable points equation in (a), (b), or (c), below. Any
two or more building permits for the samie structure that are applied for in any 12 month period
shall be considered as one application for the purpose of calculating points.

1. Calculation of Points. Points are accumulated based on the total square feet
. of Conditioned Space and the number of bedrooms included in the Addition or New Construction
project or the square footage of an exterior snow melt system. Points shall be rounded down to the
nearest 0.5 (example: a points equation resulting in 2.7 points shall be rounded down to 2.5 points
and a points equation resulting in 3.4 points shall be rounded down to 3.0 points) '
a. Points equation for New Construction. (Square footage of
Condltloned Space)/ (number of bedrooms) x 0.01 = required points.

-133-



: i) Points shall be applied to the construction of the new residential
Building. ‘ _

b. Points equation for Additions. (Square footage of Conditioned
Space of Addition) / (Number of bedrooms included in Addition + 1) x 0.01 = required points.
i) Points shall be applied to the Addition, existing structure, or a '
combination of both.
c. Points equation for exterior snow melt systems. (Square footage of
exterior sniow melt)/100 = required points. '
' i) Points shall be applied to‘the new or existing structure, or.a
combination of both, if applicable, and shall only be obtained from Section 15.08.012.E.5, Energy
Efficiency. ‘

: 2. Restrictions. When points are required for more than one construction
activity, the same item cannot count as a point(s) for satisfying multiple point requirements under
more than one construction activity. ‘

, 3. Verification. Before final inspection, a Verification of Accountability by
Responsible Party form shall be submitted, along with supporting documentation such as copies
of receipts and invoices, material packaging, and photos, unless an alternative method of
verification is specified herein. ’

4. Waste Management.
a. Reuse Existing Building. Up to 5 points.
| Points | Percent of Exterior Walls saved
: (external sheathing and framing)
3 50%

5 75%
b. New Construction Waste Recycling. Up to 3 points.
1) Application. points will be awarded according to the
following table:
Points - | Percentage Waste Percentage Diverted |
1 75% ‘ 25% '
2 50% 50%
3. 125% 75%
5. - Energy Efficiency.
a. Insulation. Up to 7 points.

i) Wall Insulation. 2 points. :
(1) Application. R-24 minimum wall cavity insulation.
(2) Verification. Checked during plan review by the
Program Administrators and verified by the Certified HERS Rater for New Construction and
checked during plan review and verified by the Program Administrators for Additions.
ii) Basement or Foundation Insulation. 1 to 5 points.
(1) Application. Insulation must be installed on the full
height of a basement or foundation wall.
(2) Verification. Checked during plan review by the
Program Administrators and verified by the Certified HERS Rater for New Construction and

-134-



checked during plan review and verified by the Program Administrators for Additions.

Points | R-Value and insulated concrete forms

1 15, or

2 20, or

3 25, and

2 Use of insulated concrete forms

on the foundation (stem wall and footing)

b. Windows. Up to 3 points.
i) Application. New windows or replacement wmdows installed as
part of an Addition are awarded points as follows:

Points | Maximum U-factor*
1 0.3

2 0.28

3 0.26

* U—factor as established by the National Fenestration Rating Council (NFRC).

ii) Verification. Checked during plan review by the Program
Adrmmstrators and verified by the Certified HERS Rater for New Construction and checked
during plan review and verified by the Program Administrators for Additions. The inspector must
be able to clearly identify the U-factor and Solar Heat Gain Coefficient (SHGC) ratings and
window type by the National Fenestration Rating Council’s stamp or the manufacturer’s label.
Applicant must show the number of windows to be upgraded on Building plans.

c. Air Sealing of an Existing Building. Up to 4 points.

1) These pomts shall not be applied to New Construction act1v1ty.
* Points will be awarded when a HERS rating is applied to the existing structure before and after
constructlon showing the following blower door results:

Points | Natural A1r Changes Per Hour at 50 Pascal
1 4 .
2 3
3 ‘ 2
14 1
d. Heating. Ventilation, and Air Conditioning (HVAC) Systems.

i) HVAC Commissioning. 1 point for each commissioning that
applies; up to 3 points. , X
' (1) Application. 1) test for duct leakage at a 6% target to
floor area ratio at 50 Pascal, 2) test and adjust firing rate to within recommended manufacturer
specifications and suitable to occupant condmons and 3) test and adjust refrigerant charge to
manufacturer specifications.

ii) Heat Pumps.

Points | Type of source pump installed
8 Water

6 Ground

4 Air

iii) Sealed combustion or power vent assisted Water Heating

System. 2 Points.
(1) Verification. New Constructions - checked during plan

-135-



review by the Program Administrators and verified by the Certified HERS Rater. Additions -
checked during plan review and verified by the Program Administrators.

iv) ENERGY STAR boiler, furnace, or hot water heater: 2 points
each. :
e. Zoned, Hydronic Radiant Heating. 2 points.

i) Application. Use a Zoned Hydronic Radiant Heating system that
circulates hot water through radiant floor panels, wall radiators, or baseboard convectors located
in different areas or zones of the house.

: ii) Verification. Checked during plan review. Inspected in field.
f. Passive Cooling. 2 to 5 points.

i) Application. Any combination of natural cooling techniques can
be used to reduce overheating in homes. Use awnings and window overhangs primarily on south-
facing glass to provide a balance between summer cooling and winter heating through solar gain.
Points will be awarded for passive cooling systems using any two or more of these techniques
(one point per option):

(1) Exterior vertical shading devices for east- and west-
facing glass. ,

(2) Low emissivity films on glass on east- and west-facing
windows. -

(3) Radiant barriers installed in the attic space.

(4) Landscaping that shades east- and west-facing windows
during the cooling season (June to.September). S

(5) South Wmdow overhang s1zed to effectlvely shade the
window (from June to September).

i) Verification.

(1) New Constructions: checked during plan review by the
Program Administrators and verified by the Certified HERS Rater.

(2) Additions: checked during plan review and verified by
the Program Administrators. Indicate the passive cooling design features on the Building Permit
plan, for option number 5 above; subinit a calculation that demonstrates overhangs have been
designed in accordance with the equation below for all south-facing glass. The formula below will
result in window overhangs that shade 100 percent of south facmg window glazing on June 21
(summer solstice).

(3) Applicants should use this formula as a guide for sizing
all south-facing overhangs:

D = H/F where:

D = Distance of overhang

H = Height from bottom of glass to overhang

F =3.38 (F is a value corresponding to the noon sun altitude angle on June 21st)
g. ~ Whole House Fan. 2 points.

i) Application. Install a Whole House Fan with an insulated cover
that creates an airtight seal between attic and living space when the fan is off. For maximum
effectiveness, the fan should be mounted in a hallway ceiling on the top floor of the house, and
should be sized to produce four to five air changes per hour within the home.

i) Verification. Checked during plan review by the Program
Administrators and verified by the Certified HERS Rater for New Construction and checked

-136-



during plan review and verified by the Program Administrators for Additions.
h. Water Heating. Up to 2 points.

i) Application. Point-of-use water heating uses a mini-water heater
at remote fixtures to reduce the energy and water use associated with long piping runs. They are
sized to supply hot water to a single fixture such as a sink. Gas-fired models must have a
minimum energy factor of 0.82 to achieve this credit. '

Points | Type of water heater
2 Tankless

2 Point of Use

2 Indirect fired

ii) Verification.

(1) New Constructions. Checked during plan review by the
Program Administrators and verified by the Certified HERS Rater. _

(2) Additions. Checked during plan review and verified by
the Program Administrators. ' .
i Lighting and Appliances.
i) ENERGY STAR qualified CFLs or LEDs. 5 pomts

(1) Application. L1crht1n0 shall be installed in accordance

with the lighting table below.

(2) Any exterior 11ght1n<> fixture must comply with city of
Halley Outdoor Lighting Ordinance requirements.

Rooms : Requlred percentage of installed
ENERGY STAR qualified CFL or
LEDs

Kitchen, dining room, | 50 percent of total number of fixtures
living room, family -
room bathroom(s),
hall(s)/stairway(s)

Bedroom(s), den, 25 percent of total number of fixtures
office, basement, -

laundry room, garage,
closet(s), and all other
rooms

Outdoor lighting 50 percent of total number of fixtures
affixed to the including all flood lighting

structure or free- :
| standing pole(s)

| - except for landscape
and solar lighting

(3) Verification. Checked during plan review by the
Program Administrators and verified by the Certified HERS Rater for New Construction and

, | -137-



checked during plan review and verified by the Program Administrators for Additions.
i) Efficient Light Controls. Up to 2 points.

(1) Application. Efficient lighting controls include
occupancy sensors, dimming controls, and automatic daylight dimming controls. Points will be
awarded for efficient light controls according to the following:

[ Points | Number of control devices
1|4 '
2 6
(2) Verification. New Construction shall be checked during
plan review by the Program Administrators and verified by the Certified HERS Rater and
Additions shall be checked during plan review and verified by the Program Administrators.
] Enelgv Efficient Appliances. Up to 6 points.

(1)  Application. Points will be awarded for ENERGY

STAR appliances according to the following:

Points | Type of ENERGY STAR rated appliance
2 Refrigerator

2 Clothes washer =~

1 Freezer, not patt of refrigerator appliance
1 Dishwasher

(2)  Verification. New Construction will be verified by
the Certified HERS Rater and Additions will be verified by the Program Administrators.” = ™
Appliance ENERGY STAR labels must remain on the equipment for inspection by a Certified
HERS Rater or Building Inspector.

6. Solar.
a. Passive Solar Heating Design. Up to 12 points.

i) Apphcatlon Points will be awarded in accordance with the
following table, by designing with passive solar heating elements of south-facing glazing,
appropriate thermal mass, and Building overhangs:

Points | Percent verifying calculations of the Solar Heat Gain Coefficient

6 | 40-49%
8 50-59%
10 | 60-69%

12 More than 70%
i) Verification. Inspected durlno plan review. Submit modeling

documentation with the designer or archltect s signature verifying calculations of the Solar Heat

Gain Coefficient.

b. Solar Thermal Domestic Hot Water System. 8 points.
i) Application. A solar water heating system shall include south-

facing rooftop or ground-mounted collectors, a heat exchanger to transfer the solar heat to the
domestic water, and an insulated storage tank to store the heated water. The system shall be sized
to provide at least 50 percent of the domestic hot water load. Sufficient unshaded south-facing
roof area for collectors and space in a mechanical equipment room must be provided for the
additional hot water storage tank.

ii) Verification. Checked during plan review by the Program
Administrators and verified by the Certified HERS Rater for New Construction and checked

-138-



durmo plan review and verified by the Program Administrators for Additions.
C. Pre-Plumb for Solar Thermal Svstem Retrofit and include area

required for future tanks and pumps. 2 points.

i) Application. Install minimum %" (5/8” OD) copper pipes,
minimum 17 wall thickness high temperature 250°F rated insulation, and THN shielded 4
conductor sensor wiring between the attic and the water heater location. To accommodate “active”
systems, provisions shall be made for a solar storage tank footprint, with pressure relief drain line,
and an electrical outlet for a pump. An 8 ft. by 8 ft. section of south-facing roof suitable for future
installation of solar panels shall be provided.

i) Verification. Checked during plan review by the Program
Administrators and a Verification of Accountability by Responsible Party form shall be submitted,
before the final inspection.

- d. Active Solar Electric System. Up to 12 Points.

i) Application. Design and install a solar PV system to meet some

of the electrical load of the Building.

Points | size of kilowatt (kW) system
6 2 :

8 3

10 4

12 5 or larger

ii) Verification. The applicant must submit documentation by a
quahﬁed engineer or equivalent of the solar installation company of the electrical production
calculations using industry-accepted formulas. Installation verified by the Certified HERS Rater.

‘ e. Pre-Wire, or Chase Way. or Conduit. and Prov1de Area for Future:
Solar Electric. Photovoltaic (PV) System Retrofit. 2 points.

i) Application. Prewire, chase way, or conduit from the atticto a
Jocation near the electric service entrance/circuit breaker panel, allowing space for installation of
PV modules on south-facing roofs, and ensuring that roof trusses are adequate to accommodate
any added roof loads. maintain a 200 square foot or larger section of unshaded south roof area
clear of vent pipes and other obstructions to allow for the installation of modules. Install %-inch or
Jarger EMT (electrical metal tubing) or FMC (flexible metal conduit) to accommodate Wires run
from the attic to a junction box near the main panel and meter. Provide the owner with a roof plan
with the preferred location for PV modules and the conduit location clearly marked, and provide
structural information on what added loads the roof can accommodate.

ii) Verification. checked during plans review and a Verification of
Accountability by Responsible Party form shall be submitted, before the final inspection.

7. Material Efficient Framing and Structure
a. Advanced Framing Techniques: 2 to 10 points.
' i) Verification. Checked during plans review and a Verification of
Accountability by Responsible Party form shall'be submitted, before the final inspection.
A ii) 24-inch On-Center Framing: 2 points.

iii) Resource Efficient Insulated Headers: 2 points.

(1) " Application. points are awarded for incorporating a
minimum R-10 insulation in the header section. '

iv) Trusses with energy heel: 2 points.

>

-139-



v) HVAC Ducts Within Conditioned Spaces: 2 points.

vi) Minimum 24-inch Roof Overhangs: 2 points.

(1) Application. Design at least a 12-inch overhang with
gutters around the Building’s entire roof. Install gutter and downspout system to divert water five
feet away from foundation and, from there, into the overall on-site drainage area or install crushed
stone or other material below roof drip line to minimize splash on siding in high snow areas. All
overhangs must meet Building code and zoning restrictions.

b. Structural Insulated Panels (SIPs) in Conditioned Spaces or an
Alternatives to Wood Framing Approved by the Program Administrators. Up to 8 points.
i) Application. incorporating SIP construction requires that stamped
plans be submitted from a designer. ’
Points | Percent of structure
5 At least 50% of Exterior Walls
8 At least 50% of Exterior Walls and roof
ii) Verification. Checked during plans review and a Verification of
Accountability by Responsible Party form shall be submitted, before the final inspection.
c. Other Alternatives to Wood Framing. Up to 8 points.

i) Application. exterior walls must be constructed with alternative
materials. Alternative Building methods that demonstrate energy- and resource-efficient
construction with less embodied energy are awarded points according to the following:

Points | Percent of structure
15 | At least 50% of Exterior Walls
8 At least 50% of Exterior Walls and roof )
ii) Verification. Checked during plans review and a Verification of
Accountability by Responsible Party form shall be submitted, before the final inspection.
8. Sustainable Products.
a. Forest Stewardship Council (FSC) Certified. Up to 6 points.

Points | Number of board feet (BF) of FSC lumber per square feet (SF) of floor area
2 2 BF per SF of floor area (2BF/SF) '
4 3 BF per SF of floor area (3 BF/SF) ,
16 50% or more of dimensional lumber in total BF is FSC, excluding engineered wood
products ’ : -
b. Environmentally Preferred. Low Emission. and Local Materials. Up

to 10 points from Chart A. o

: i) Application. For each assembly, all product specification type
requirements shall be met in order to receive the points available. Environmentally preferred and
low emission qualifying products have more than one of these attributes: recycled content,
reclaimed, bio-based, agricultural residue, rapidly renewable, and low or no volatile organic
compounds (VOCs) emissions. A “recycled content” product must contain a minimum of 25
percent post-consumer recycled content except as noted otherwise above. Post-industrial (pre-
consumer) recycled content is counted at half the rate of post-consumer content. Except as
otherwise noted in Chart A, 90 percent of the component, by weight or volume, must meet the
specification shown. Locally sourced materials are products that are manufactured within 500
miles of the city are considered local.

Chart A: Environmentallv Preferable Products/Locally Sourced Materials

-140-




. Product Specification Types

~Sp§ciﬁc§t10n§ e

Pl e [ 727 Ay

_Sﬁﬁ i
Specifications ailable

o Forest

Exterior Framing - Stewardship
Wall _ Council (FSC)

Certified

Finger-jointed

‘ , studs (vertical -
Framing use only for X 1
structural

components)

Exterior
Wall

Recycled
: content or
Exterior Siding or |. Forest
Wall masonry Stewardship
Council (FSC)
Certified

NO carpet in

Floor | Flooring 90% of home h
lome

Forest
Stewardship
Council (FSC)
Certified

Floor Framing

Fly ash or slag
as replacement
for, not
Addition to,
cement content
(min. 20%)

Foundation Cement

Forest

Interior Framiné Stewardship
Wall © Council (FSC)

Certified

Finger-Jointed,

Interior Framine (vertical use
Wall = only for

structural

-141-




components)

Interior
Walls Gypsum Recycled |
AND - board content
ceilings
Comply with
Green Seal
Standard GS-11,
Interior Paints, First
Walls . Edition, May 20,
AND Paint 1993 (0.5 points) 0.5
millwork
48 hour pre-
occupancy flush
(0.5 points)
Interior
Walls Wood VO(?
. concentrations of 0.5
AND finishes 150 gpl or les
millwork &P 5
Recycled |
Decking content or
Landscape or patio Forest » 1
material Stewardship
Council (FSC)
Certified
Recovered, Wood and/or
recycled .
agrifiber
content, or roducts with no
Other Cabinets Forest P 1.5
. added urea-
Stewardship formaldehyde
Council (FSC) e
Certified
Wood and/or
agrifiber
Other Counters Recycled products with no 1
content added urea-
formaldehyde
resing
Doors (not Recycled Wooc‘! and/or
. content or agrifiber
Other incl. . 1.5
arage) Forest products with no
gatags Stewardship added urea-

-142-



Council (FSC)
Certified

formaldehyde
resins

Other

Trim

Recovered,
recycled
content, or
Forest
Stewardship
Council (FSC)

~ Certified

Wood and/or
agrifiber
products with no

added urea-
formaldehyde
resins

Other

Adhesives
and
sealants

VOC
concentrations of
70 gpl or less

0.5

Other

Windows

Recycled
content or
Forest
Stewardship
Council (FSC)
Certified

Roof

Framing

Forest
Stewardship

Council (FSC)

Certified

Roof

Roofing

Recycled
content or
vegetated (min.
200 sf)

Roof

“AND

floor
AND wall

Insulation

Recycled
content (min
20%)

Roof,
floor, wall
(2 of 3)

Sheathing

Recycled
content or
Forest
Stewardship
Council (FSC)
Certified

Indoor Air Quality.

a. ENERGY STAR’s Indoor airPLUS (IAP) Requirements. 5 points.

i) Application. Only New Construction that obtains ENERGY

STAR is eligible for this label. For this point option, all of the requirements of ENERGY STAR

TIAP must be met.

-143-




ii) Verification. An ENERGY STAR Home Performance Specialist
must perform a visual inspection of installed measure(s) and relevant documents/test results, to
 affirm compliance or submit an IAP certificate prior to final inspection.

b. Mechanical Ventilation. Up to 5 points.

ii) Application. Energy Recovery Ventilators must be integrated

into the HVAC system. points are awarded for providing mechanical ventilation according to the

following table:
Points | Type of fan and location
1 Kitchen exhaust fan (minimum 100 cfm)
1 Bath exhaust fan with timer or Humidistat controls (minimum 50 cﬁn)
1 Ventilation integrated into the HVAC system
2 Energy Recovery Ventilation System

ii) Verification. Checked during mechanical inspection. The state
mechanical inspector shall complete a Verification of Accountability by Responsible Party form,
which shall be submitted, before the final inspection.

c. High-Efficiency HVAC Filter.

i) Filters with MERV ratings of 6 to 10. 1 point.
(1) Application. Any MERV with a rating from 6 to 10.
- Filters with a MERYV rating of higher than 10 may be used only if the HVAC fan system is
specifically designed for it. » '
: d. ° Attached Garage Exhaust Fan. 1 point.
: ' i) Application. Install an exhaust fan-on the opposite wall from the .
door to the house. It shall be wired to an electric garage door to run after the d001 has been opened
or closed or put on a timer.
10. Homeowner Information - Operations and Maintenance Binder. 3 points.

a. Application. The builder shall provide a binder to be left in the
dwelling for future occupants that includes the following three items: '
- 1) The points checklist

ii) HERS Index score certificate ‘

iii) The equipment manufacturers’ installation manuals, except for
manuals required to be affixed to the equipment, fo1 all installed equipment, fixtures, and
appliances

b. Verification. Submltted to the Program Administrators for review
and inspected during final inspection. '
11.  Design Process and Innovation.
a. Green Building Consultants. 1 point.

i) Application. Use services provided by a consultant(s) certified
through, Green Advantage, LEED AP, Certified Sustainable Building Advisor, or similar
cert1ﬁcat10n Approved by the Program Administrators during the design and construction process.

if) Verification. A green building consultant must sign the
Verification of Accountability by Responsible Party form and provide proof of certification or
accreditation during Building plans submittal.

b. ENERGY STAR Builder. 1 point

i) Application. Applies to New Construction Only. The general
contractor must be an ENERGY STAR Builder.

ii) Verification. The builder must sign the Verification of

-144-



Accountability by Responsible Party form and the builder’s name must be listed on ENERGY
STAR’s web site.
c. Innovation Points. 3 points. :

i) Application. Minimize the environmental impact of the house by
incorporating green design and construction measures that have tangible and demonstrable
benefits beyond those outlined in the points program. Suggested innovations include: exceptional
performance (e.g., zero energy, carbon neutral); innovative design strategies; or emerging
technologies, materials, or construction practices. The applicant MUST prepare a written
submittal that includes: ' : '

(1) The intent of the innovation measure(s)

(2) The proposed requirement for compliance

(3) The proposed documentation to demonstrate compliance
(4) A description and an estimate of the benefit/impact .

provided by the proposed measure ‘

ii) The above information must document how such an approach
will minimize the impacts of the Building in a tangible and demonstrable way beyond the methods
outlined in the Build Better Point Menu. The product, design, or technology must comply with
existing city codes and standards. | ‘

iii) Verification. Applicant must provide the above documentation
in writing and any other supporting documentation, such as an evaluation report or specifications
to quantify performance. This information is submitted with Building Permit plans and will be
awarded during city staff’s evaluation and determination of measures proposed.

Section 2. Section 15.08.030 of the Hailey Municipal Code is amended by the addition of the
underlined language, as follows: ‘ - .

15.08.030 Additional requirements. The following regulations shall apply in addition to those
contained in the adopted codes and standards. '

A. Manufactured Homes. The city of Hailey adopts by reference the “Idaho
Manufactured Home Installation Standard” as published by the state of Idaho, September, 1999,
compiled jointly by the Manufactured Housing Industry, as may be modified and adopted by the
state of Idaho. Said “Standard” shall be known as the “Manufactured Housing Code.”

B. Special Natural Hazard. Understanding that certain natural hazards exist in the
jurisdiction including, but not limited to avalanche areas, earthquake, floodplain, snow loads,

- wildfires and soil qualities, site specific surveys and related engineering may be required as
- deemed appropriate by the authority of the jurisdiction.

. C Plumbine and Electrical Inspections Prerequisite. The framing inspection by the
city of Hailey Building department shall not be conducted until the applicant has obtained a rough
~ plumbing and electrical inspection from the Idaho State Plumbing and Electrical Inspectors. The
final inspection shall not be conducted until the applicant has obtained a final plumbing and
electrical inspection.

D. Salvaged Building Materials. The use of salvaged Building materials may be
Approved by the Building Official upon receipt of a complete list of those materials accompanied
with written approval of such materials by an Idaho Licensed Structural Engineer. Said materials
shall be capable of meeting design criteria for the proposed project.

-145-



E. Insulation of Stem Wall. In reference to residential construction, perimeter stem
wall insulation practices shall be considered as equal and equivalent insulation criteria when
considering thermal Building envelope efficiencies using energy code thermal design parameters.
F. Increased energy efficiency and sustainable Building practices. An increase in
efficiency by 10% above the IECC and other sustainable Building practices and materials
shall be followed. as specified by Section 15.08.012. Build Better Program, provided the activity
is not listed as an exception in Section 101.4.3 of the IECC or an exemption in Section 15.08.012.

A.3.4..0or5.

Section 3. Severability Clause. If any section, paragraph, sentence or provision hereof or the
application thereof to any particular circumstances shall ever be held invalid or unenforceable,
such holding shall not affect the remainder hereof, which shall continue in full force and effect
and applicable to all circumstances to which it may validly apply.

Section 4. Repealer Clause. All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are
hereby repealed.

Section 5. Effective Date. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect after its passage,
approval and publication according to law.

ADOPTED BY THE HAILEY CITY COUNCIL AND APPROVED BY THE MAYOR
this - day of December, 2013... s e e s

Fritz H. Haemmerle
Mayor, City of Hailey

ATTEST:

Mary Cone, City Clerk (Seal)

-146-



AGENDA ITEM SUMMARY

DATE: 12/17/2012 DEPARTMENT: CDD  DEPT. HEAD SIGNATURE: MA

SUBJECT: Adopt proposed Amendments to Title 15, “Bulldlngs and Construction” as
Ordinance No. and proceed with three readings of the ordinance

AUTHORITY: O ID Code 39-4116 I IAR O City Ordinance/Code Title 15
(IFAPPLICABLE)

BACKGROUND/SUMMARY OF ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Update from 11-19-2012 City Council Meeting

Following the 11-19-2012 meeting of the City Council, staff worked with the City Attorney
in drafting the proposed ordinance to make the changes as recommended below. During this
process, staff discovered that the Building Ordinance, Title 15, was outdated and inaccurate in
several places. For example, the majority of references to the IRC and IBC were inaccurate
and inconsistent throughout Title 15. This amendment cleans up and corrects those
inaccuracies and rewrites the ordinance to avoid these issues in the future.

The proposed ordinance corrects these non-material inaccuracies and makes the
following changes with explanations:

Proposed Amendments:

Alternative Energy Review Fee (15.08. 020 E)
e Amend Title 15 to allow for a flat fee of $75 per Alternative Energy System apphca’uon
~ « Any additional inspections beyond the initial inspection will be $50

Bu;ldmg Permit Term of Validity (15.08.020 B)
o Insert language stating that a Building Permit becomes null and void if there has been no
activity (defined by no inspections) during a period of 180 days.

Final Inspection Fee Deposit (15.08.020 E)
o Waive the Final Inspection Fee Deposit

Window Replacement Fees (15.08.020 E, Similar to Alt. Energy Review changes above)
o Amend Title 15 to allow for a flat fee of $75 per windows inspection
o Any additional inspections beyond the initial inspection will be $50

Build Better Program (BBP) (15.08.012)
e« NOTE : Amendments to the Building Ordinance addressing the Building Better Program
will be addressed in a separate ordinance and as a separate public hearing.

FISCAL IMPACT / PROJECT FINANCIAL ANALYSIS:

There may be a slight reduction in building permit fees based on the windows and alternative
energy system reviews. '

-147-



ACKNOWLEDGEMENT BY OTHER AFFECTED CITY DEPARTMENTS: (IFAPPLICABLE)

X City Administrator | Library L] Benefits Committee
X City Attorney [l Mayor L] Streets
| City Clerk Planning ] Treasurer
Building [l  Police X Sustainability
[l Engineer [0l  Public Works, []
[]  Fire Dept. Parks ]
X P & Z Commission

RECOMMENDATION FROM APPLICABLE DEPARTMENT HEAD:

Motion to approve the proposed amendments to Hailey Municipal Code Title 15, the Building
Code, and adopt Ordinance No and authorize the mayor to conduct the first reading by
title only.

ACTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL.:
Date :
City Clerk

FOLLOW-UP:

*Ord./Res./Agrmt./Order Originals: Recbrd *Additional/Exceptional Originals to:

¥ ‘
Copies (all info.): Copies (AlS only)
Instrument # § o

-148~



STAFF REPORT

TO: Mayor Haemmerle and the Hailey City Council
FROM: Micah Austin, Community Development Director
RE: Hailey Municipal Code Amendment to Title 15, the Building Code.

HEARING: December 17,2012

Notice
Not1ce for the public hearing was published in the Idaho Mountain Express on November 28, 2012

Proposal
A text amendment to Title 15, the Building Code, to add an Alternative Energy Review Fee, a Window

Inspection Fee, change the terms of permit validity, eliminate the final inspection fee deposit, and make
several housekeeping changes where inaccuracies occur between our code and the IRC and IBC.

.Procedural History
The public hearing for December 17 was published in the Mt. Express on November 28. If the Counc11
chooses to proceed with adoption, the following schedule will be observed:
e 1**Reading: December 17
o 2 Reading: January 7, 2013
" o 3“Reading: January 21, 2013

Department Comments

Following the 11-19-2012 meeting of the City Council, staff worked with the City Attomey in
drafting the proposed ordinance to make the changes as recommended below. Durmcr this process, staff
discovered that the Building Ordinance, Title 15, was outdated and inaccurate in several places. For
example, the majority of references to the IRC and IBC were inaccurate and inconsistent throughout Title
15. This amendment cleans up and corrects those inaccuracies and rewrites the ordinance to avoid these
issues in the future.

The proposed ordinance corrects these non-material inaccuracies and makes the following
changes with explanations:

Proposed Amendments and Explanations:

Alternative Energy Review Fee (15.08.020 E)

e Recommendation: Amend Title 15 to allow for a flat fee of $50 per Alternative Energy System
application. :

o Any additional inspections beyond one initial inspection will be $50

e Our current fee assessment is based on the total value of the project, rather than the time required
for the inspection.

e Both Wayne Orvik, our past Building Ofﬁ01a1 and Cedric Knehans (DBS) have recommended
this change to the ordinance because the amount of staff time required for the inspection of an
Alternative Energy System is identical, regardless of the cost of the system.

o The objective of this amendment is to equitably assess the inspection/review fee for an
altemnative energy system and to incentivize any businesses or homeowners to invest in an
alternative energy system by reducing the building permit fees.

-149-



Building Code Amendment, Title 15
City Council — December 17,2012
Page 2 of 3

Building Permit Term of Validity (15.08.020 B)

Recommendation: Insert language stating that a Building Permit becomes null and void if there
has been no activity (defined by no inspections) during a period of 180 days.

Currently, our ordinance states that a permit becomes null and void after 548 days.

This revision is consistent with the International Building Code’s requirements

The objective is to keep projects progressing and to prevent having unfinished projects remain
unsightly eyesores in neighborhoods for several months or years.

Final Inspection Fee Deposit (15.08.020 E)

Recommendation: Waive the Final Inspection Fee Deposit

We currently hold a deposit of 25% of the total Building Permit Fee and Plan Review Fee. This

deposit is release after the final inspection is completed.

Objective: According to our recommendation above, with the Building Permit expiring after 180
day of inactivity, the need for a Final Inspection Fee Deposit is not necessary

If implemented, staff plans to evaluate this in 12 months to determine whether waiving the fee
has achieved our desired objectives.

Window Replacement Fees (15.08.020 E, Similar to Alt. Energy Review changes above)

Recommendation: Amend Title 15 to allow for a flat fee of $75 per windows inspection
Any additional inspections beyond the initial inspection will be $50

Our current fee assessment is based on the total value of the proj ect rather than the t1me requu‘ed

for the inspection.
Both Wayne Orvik, our past Building Official, and Cedric Knehans (DBS) have recommended
this change to the ordinance because the amount of staff time required for the inspection of a
window installation is identical, regardless of the cost of the window.

The objective of this amendment is to equitably assess the mspect10n/rev1ew fee for a window
and to incentivize any businesses or homeowners to invest in the most energy efﬁc1ent highest
quality windows possible. .

-Motion Language

Approval:

Continuation:
Motion to continue the pubhc hearmg upon the proposed amendment to Title 15, the Buﬂdlng Code, to

Table:

~150-



Building Code Amendment, Title 15
City Council —December 17, 2012
Page 3 of 3

Motion to table the proposed amendment to Title 15.

fl5l-



HAILEY ORDINANCE NO.

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF HAILEY, IDAHO, AMENDING SECTION
15.08.010 OF THE HAILEY MUNICIPAL CODE, TO REFER TO ADOPTED
BUILDING AND ENERGY CODES; AMENDING SECTION 15.08.020 OF THE
HAILEY MUNICIPAL CODE, TO PROVIDE A FLAT FEE FOR ALTERNATIVE
ENERGY SYSTEMS AND WINDOW REPLACEMENT " APPLICATIONS, TO
WAIVE THE FINAL INSPECTION FEE AND TO GENERALLY REFER TO
ADOPTED BUILDING AND ENERGY CODES; PROVIDING FOR A
SEVERABILITY CLAUSE; PROVIDING FOR A REPEALER CLAUSE; AND
PROVIDING FOR THE EFFECTIVE DATE OF THIS ORDINANCE.

WHEREAS, the City of Hailey has established fees for certain applications under
the International Building Code and International Residential Code;

WHEREAS, the City of Hailey wishes to update certain fees under the
International Building Code and International Residential Code to eliminate fees which
are based on value of improvements and to establish fees based on actual time devoted to
enforce regulations by adopting flat fees for alternative energy system and window
replacement applications and by waiving the final inspection free; and

WHEREAS, the City of Hailey wishes to generally refer to the adopted
International Building Code, International Residential Code and International Energy
Conservation Code.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL
OF THE CITY OF HAILEY, IDAHO, AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1.  Section 15.08.010 of the Hailey Municipal Code is hereby amended by the
deletion of the stricken language and by the addition of the underlined language, as
follows: ‘

15.08.010 Adoption of Codes. Pursuant to Idaho Code Section 39-4116(1), the
following codes published by the International Code Council are adopted by reference:

A. 2009 International Building Code (“2009 IBC”), including all rules
promulgated by the Idaho Building Code Board to provide equivalency with the
provisions of the Americans with Disabilities Act accessibility guidelines and the Federal
Fair Housing Act accessibility guidelines; and including Appendix E: Supplemental
Accessibility Requirements;

B. 2009 International Residential Code (“2009 IRC”), parts I-IV and IX
including Appendix F: Radon Control Methods;

C. 2009 International Energy Conservation Code (“2809-IECC”);

-1-

-152-



D. 1997 Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings;

E. 1997 Umform Building Code (“97 UBC”) Volume 3, Material, Testing and
Installation Standards; and

F. 1997 Uniform Building Code, Volume 1, Table 1-A, Building Permit Fees.

Section 2.  Section 15.08.020 of the Hailey Municipal Code is hereby amended by the
deletion of the stricken language and the addition of the underlined language, as follows:

15.08.020 Amendment of Codes. Pursuant to Idaho Code Section 39-4116(3), the
following codes adopted pursuant to Section 15.08.010 herein or provisions thereof are
added to, amended, altered and/or modified as follows:

A. Required Pemmits. Required building permit applications shall be made on
forms furnished by the city of Hailey, and approval shall be in accordance with Section -
165 R105.1 of the 2006 IRC and Section 105 3410 of 2066 IBC.

: 1. Excavation. Section 105.1 of the 2006 IRC and 2006 IBC require a
permit from the building official for the start of construction. For the purposes of this
section, the start of construction is defined as the excavation or trenching for the
- installation of forms for footings, or where no forms are used, start of constructlon 18
excavation or trenching.

2. Moved Structures. The 2606 IRC is amended to add the following
Section +05-+ R105.3.3 and the 2666 IBC is amended to add the following $653-3
~ 105.3.3: Moved Structures. Applications for permits for moved structures shall include
but are not limited to the following information provided by an Idaho licensed structural
engineer: appropriate foundation designed to meet the City of Hailey structural forces:
proof that existing headers of the largest window and/or garage door opening is
structurally adequate; where practical, an analysis of the existing roof system including
trusses or rafters and roof sheathing materials, wall and floor systems for conformity to
strucfural forces criteria for the new occupancy and new location.

3. Manufactured Homes. The 2006 IRC is amended to add the
followmg Section R105.1.2 and the 2006 IBC is amended to add the following 105.1.4:
Manufactured Homes. Permits are required for manufactured homes pursuant to this
code.

4. Demolition Permits. The 2606 IRC is amended to add the

following Section R105.1.3 and the 2606-IBC is amended to add the following 105.1.35.

a. General Requirements. Demolition shall include moving a
structure from one site to another and destruction/demolition of a structure for disposal.
Permit applications shall be provided by the City of Hailey and shall include owner,
address, property descriptions, phone number, description of the scope of the demolition
and a time frame. The person or entity submitting an application for a demolition permit
for a Historic Structure must be the owner of record or the authorized agent of the
owner(s). Acknowledgement of the demolition by utility companies serving the property,
~ the Blaine County Assessor’s office and the jurisdiction’s Building Official if other than
the City of Hailey shall be required. Permits shall be valid for 90 days.

-153-



b. Historic Structures. Prior to issuance of a “Demolition”
permit for buildings and structures built wholly or in part prior to 1941 (“Historic
Structure”), regardless whether the Historic Structure was constructed on or relocated to
the property, the Hailey Building Official shall submit the application to the Hailey
Planning Department, Hailey Fire Department and Hailey Historic Preservation
Commission. The applicant shall demonstrate the age of a building or structure by
reliable records, including but not limited to records of the Blaine County Assessor.

: 1. A one hundred twenty (120) day review period shall run
from the date of transmittal of copies of the application to the departments, agencies,
commissions and organizations. The date of transmittal shall be documented in the
application file and shall commence the comment period. Within seven (7) calendar days
of the Building Official certifying that the application is complete, the Building Official
shall, at the applicant’s expense, publish a Notice of Intent to Demolish a Historic
Structure in the official newspaper of the City of Hailey, post on the subject property a
Notice of Intent to Demolish a Historic Structure, and mail Notice of Intent to Demolish a
" Historic Structure to property owners within three hundred (300) feet of the subject

propeﬁy.

: 2. During the review period, the city, the Hailey Historic
Preservation Commission or any other commission, organization or individual may
negotiate with the owner and with any other parties in an effort to find a means of
preserving the structure or building for the acquisition by gift, purchase, or exchange of

the property or any interest thereir. -
, 3. The one hundred twenty (120) day review period may
be reduced if the Building Official or his/her designee finds that a) the owner has
reasonably demonstrated that rehabilitation of the Historic Structure would not be
economically feasible, b) the Historic Structure shall be preserved by relocation of the
building or structure to another appropriate site in Hailey, c) the Historic Structure is
deemed a “dangerous” building as defined in Chapter 3, Section 3.02 of the 1997
Uniform Code for the Abatement of Dangerous Buildings, or d) the Hailey Historic
Preservation Commission has recommended the one hundred twenty (120) day review
period be reduced because the Historic Structure does not maintain the historic
architectural qualities, historic associations or archeological values of other Historic

Structures within Hailey.

4. At the end of the review period, if the application for a
“Demolition” permit has not been withdrawn, the Building Official shall process the
application according to the 2606 IBC and the municipal code. Any demolition permit for
Historic Structure shall be conditioned so that prior to demolition, the applicant shall
provide the Hailey Historic Preservation Commission with all available historic
information about the Historic Structure, including a) color photographs measuring at
least four inches (4”) by six inches (6) of at least two (2) elevations of the building at the
time of permit submittal (if the building faces one or more public streets, the two (2)
elevations shall be of the street facing sides), b) height, square footage, and current use of
building, and c) historical photograph, black and white or color, of the building, if
feasible.

c. - Revegetation. Following demolition of a building or
structure, any foundation and basement and all debris shall be removed, clean fill shall be

-3-

-154-



placed in any excavated portion of the property, the grade of the property shall be
leveled, and the property shall be planted or re-seeded with drought resistant grasses
and/or shrubs that are as minimally as possible irrigated to ensure successful revegetation
within one (1) month of the permitted work. The revegetation shall include noxious weed
abatement and continued maintenance until new construction commences

B. Permit Expiration. Section 105.5 of the 2006 IBC is deleted in its entirety
-and replaced by the following:

105.5 Expiration. Except as otherwise provided herein, every permit issued by
the Building Official under the provisions of this code shall expire and become null and
* void if the building or work authorized by such permit is not completed within 548 days
after its issuance. Permits that expire under this provision may be extended for a period
not to exceed 180 days by an application for extension filed with the City Council by the
permittee 30 days prior to permit expiration. A permit is considered null and void if
inspections have not been completed for a period of 180 days. An application fee of
$75.00 must be paid at the time of filing for an extension of the building permit.

C. ‘Submittal Documents. Sectioh§ 1076.1 of the 2006 IBC and 2606 IRC 15
are deleted in-its their entirety and replaced by the following:

IBC Section 1076.1 and IRC R106.1 Submittal documents. Construction
documents, special inspection and structural observation programs, and other data shall
be submitted in two .or.more sets with each application for permit. The construction
‘documents shall be prepared by a registered design professional where required by the
statutes of the jurisdiction in which the project is to be constructed. Where special
_conditions exist, the building official is authorized to require additional construction
documents to be prepared by a registered design professional. Said design professional -
shall be an Idaho State Licensed Architect and/or Idaho State Licensed Structural
Engineer. '

» D. Deferred Submittal. Section 1076.3.4.2 of the 2006 IBC shall be amended
by the addition of the following language at the end of Section 1076.3.4.2:

Section 1076.3.4.2... Furthermore, the deferred submittal may be charged a
plan review fee in addition to any and all other related building permit fees in the amount
of 100% of the first plan review related to that building permit, except when
manufactured trusses are used in an R3 and/or U occupancy, truss specification may be
submitted when available from the approved manufacturer without deferred submittal
plan check fee.

E. Fees, Deposits and Refunds. For buildings, structures and other
improvements requiring a building or other permit under this chapter, fees, deposits and
refunds shall be paid to the city of Hailey as specified herein.

1. Building Permit Fee. Fees shall be charged utilizing Table 1-A of
the 97 UBC, published by the International Conference of Building Officials (ICBO).
Building valuation shall be factored at one hundred twenty dollars (§120.00) per square

-4 -

=155~



foot. For new construction or substantial remodels, an application fee of $500 shall be
made at the time the building permit application is submitted to the city. Said fee shall be
credited to the total amount of the building permit fee, but shall be forfeited if the
building permit is not obtained by the applicant within 180 days of permit approval.
Except as otherwise provided for herein, the remainder of the building permit fee and the
deposit for final inspection shall be collected when the building permit is issued. At the
election of the applicant, payment of the remainder of the building permit fee for a
Building built according to the Build Better Program during-the-introductoryperiod
{which-shall-expireJanvary1,2013); or an Energy Star certified single family residence
may be deferred to the date of the issuance of a certificate of occupancy. For the purpose
of Section 15.08.020(E), an Energy Star certified single family residence shall mean a
single family residence certified as an Energy Star project in accordance with the
Northwest Energy Star Program, as amended. The Building built to the Build Better
Program shall mean a Building that meets the specifications outhned in Section
15.08.012.

a. New residential construction, excluding additions and
alterations, shall receive a 50% reduction in building permit fees when built in
accordance with the Build Better Program.

2. Plan Review Fee. Building Department review will be 65% of the
. building permit fee. Except as otherwise provided for herein, the plan review fee shall be
collected when the building permit is issued. At the election of the applicant, payment of
the plan review fee for an Energy Star certified single family residence or a Building
Built to the Build Better Program specifications may be deferred to the date of the
issuance of a certificate of occupancy.

a. The plan review fee for new residential construction,
excluding additions and alterations, built in accordance with the Build Better Program,
shall receive a 50% reduction. By way of example, if a building permit fee is $1000
according to Table 1-A of the 1997 UBC, the plan review fee for new residential
construction built in accordance with the Build Better Program shall be $325 ($1000 x
0.65 x 0.5).

3. Fire Review Fee. Fire Department review for commercial or
‘multi-family projects shall be 35% of the building plan review fee. Except as otherwise
‘provided for herein, the fire review fee shall be collected when the building permit is
‘issued. At the election of the applicant, payment of the fire review fee of an Energy Star
certified single family residence or a Building built to the Build Better Program
specifications may be deferred to the date of the issuance of a certificate of occupancy.
4. Deferred Submittal Fee. An additional 100% of the original plan
review fee may be charged for all deferred subm1ttals—as—set—fea#ﬂa—m§ee&eﬁ—}96%—4—2—e£
the 2003-1BC;-as-amended-by-this-chapter.
5. Moved Structure Fee. Moved structures will be calculated by
using the estimated cost of the move applied to Table 1-A of the 97 UBC.
6. Manufactured Homes Fee. Fees shall be based on the on-site
elements constructed, not the home itself.
7. Demolition Fee. Fee shall be $75 and shall be due at the time the
application is submitted to the city.

-156-



8. Re-roof Fee. Fee shall be calculated using Table 1-A of the 97
UBC. Valuation shall be based on scope of the work and materials.

9. Fence Fee. Fee will be $30 and be paid when the application is
submitted.

10. Shed Fee. Permits must be obtained for all sheds exceeding 120
square feet. Fees shall be based on Table 1-A of the 97 UBC

wh&ehe’vle-r—is—gfea%ekAlternanve Energv Rev1ew Fee. Fee shall be $75 per Alternatlve
Energy System application and shall be due at the time the application is submitted to the

city.

12. Window Replacement Fee. Fee shall be $75 per window
replacement apphcanon and shall be due at the tlme the annhcanon is subrmtted to the

F. ~ 10812 Fee Refunds. Section 10812 109.6 of the IBC is deleted in its
entirety and replaced as follows: The Building Official may authorize refunding of any
fee paid hereunder which was erroneously paid or collected. The Building Official may
authorize refunding of one hundred percent (100%) of the permit fee paid when no work
has been done under a permit issued in accordance with this code. The Building Official -
may authorize refunding of not more than one hundred percent (100%) of the plan review
fee paid when an application for a permit for which a plan review fee has been paid is
withdrawn or canceled before any plan reviewing is done. The Building Official shall not
authorize refunding of any fee paid except on written application filed by the original
permittee not later than one hundred eighty (180) days after the date of fee payment.

G.  Regquired Inspections. Section 109 110 of the 2606 IBC shall be amended
by the addition of a new section 16910.3.8.1,_as follows:

Section +89110.3.8.1 Manufactured Homes: Inspections are required for
manufactured homes placed in the City of Hailey.

H. Board of Appeals. Section 1132 of the 2006 IBC and 2066-IRC shall be
amended by the addition of a new section 1132.3.1, as follows:

Section 1132.3.1 Board Membership: The Mayor and the Hailey City Council
will appoint a three (3) person Board to stand as the Board of Appeals, as needed, with
membership to be selected from but not limited to the following l1st of professionals in
the various fields of expertise in the building industry:

o Blaine County, Idaho Building Official;

o The City of Ketchum, Idaho Building Official

o The City of Hailey Fire Chief;

e General Contractor associated with the Building Contractors
Association of the Wood River Valley;

-6-

-157-



o A licensed Idaho Architect; and,
e A licensed Idaho Structural Engineer.

I Start of Construction. Section 202 and Section 1612.2 of the 2006 IBC shall
be amended, to add the following definition:

Start of Construction:  The excavation or trenching for the installation of
forms for footings. Where no forms are used, it is excavation or trenching.

I. Height, Building. Section 502.1 of the 2006 IBC shall be amended by

deleting the definition of “Height, Building” in its entirety and replacing it with the
definition of building height contained in Chapter 2 of the Hailey Zoning Ordinance, as
amended fel}ews—

K. Fire-Resistance Rating Requirements. Table 602 of the 2606 IBC shall be
amended as follows: ,
1. All walls of buildings that are closer than five (5) feet to a property
“line shall be constructed of four (4) hour firewall materials including a parapet wall-as~
defined in the International Building Code.
Exception: Walls may be constructed of two hour firewall materials if an
approved, monitored sprinkler system is installed within the building.

2. Walls that run parallel to a-public way, street or alley, as those
terms are defined in the 2006 IBC, when said public way, street or alley is greater than
twenty (20) feet wide, shall be constructed specifically in accordance with the 2086 IBC.
Walls described in this Subsection 2 shall not be subject to the requirements of

~ Subsection 1. "

3. There shall be no openings or pénetrations allowed in the required
firewalls of buildings that are closer than five (5) feet to a property line.
4. The requirements as stated in Subsections 1, 2 and 3 above shall

apply to all zones and all types of building construction in the city of Hailey except
General Residential and Limited Residential Zones 1 and 2.

L. Live Snow Load Requirements. Section 1603.1.3 of the 2086 IBC shall
be amended by adding a new subsection 1603.1.3.1 as follows:

Section 1603.1.3.1 All roofs shall sustain within the stress limitations of this
Code, all “dead loads” plus unit “snow loads” of at least one hundred (100) pounds per
square foot. The snow loads shall be assumed to act vertically upon the area projected
upon a horizontal plane.

-158-



M. Live Load Requirements for Balconies or Second Floor Decks: Table
1607.1 of the 2006 IBC, Item 5 pertaining to balconies, shall be amended to show a 100
p.s.f. snow load for all balconies and decks regardless of occupancy or size.

N Seismic Resisting System. Section R301.2.2.3 of the 2066 IRC is
amended by the addition of the following subsection R301.2.2.3.4, as follows:

R301.2.2.3.4 Engineering design for seismic resisting system. All structures
including detached one and two family structures in Seismic Design Category C or
greater shall have a lateral force resisting system designed in accordance with accepted
engineering practice by the Engineer of Record. The effective seismic weight for such
buildings shall include 35% of the flat roof uniform design snow load.

0. Snow Loads. Section R301.2.3 of the 2006 IRC shall be amended by the
deletion of Section 301.2.3 in its entirety and replaced with the following language:

Section R301.2.3 Snow loads. All roofs shall sustain within the strees
limitations of this Code, all “dead loads” plus unit “snow loads” of at least one hundred
(100) pounds per square foot. The snow loads shall be assumed to act vertically upon the
area projected upon a honzontal plane. '

P. 2009 International Energy Conservation Code. The IECC shall be
amended as follows: :
1. 2009 JECC Chapter 4, Residential Energy Efficiency.
a. Section 401.2 Compliance. Projects shall comply with
Sections 401, 402.4, and 403.1, 403.2.2, 403.2.3, and 403.3 through 403.9 (referred to as
. mandatory prov1s1ons) and Sect1on 405 (performance)
b. Sections 402.1 through 402.3, 403.2.1 and 404.1, shall be

deleted. .

c. Section 402.4.2 Air Sealing and Insulation. Building
envelope air tightness and insulation installation shall be demonstrated to comply by
Section 402.4.2.1, Testing Option.
d. Section 402.4.2.2, Visual Inspection Option, shall be
deleted. ‘

e. . Section 405, Simulated Performance Alternative
(Performance). This section shall be met using Residential Energy Services Network’s _
(RESNET) Home Energy Rating System (HERS) by developing a simulated model of the
proposed design and comparing it to the 2009 IECC standard reference design using a
REM/RATE™ ENERGY ANALYSIS. -

2. 2009 IECC Chapter 5, Commercial Energy Efficiency.

a. Section 501.2, Application. The Commercial Building

project shall comply with the requirements of Section 506, provided Sections 502.4,
503.2, 504, 505.1, 505.2, 505.3, 505.4, 505.6, and 505.7 are each satisfied.

' b. Sections 502.1 through 502.3, 503.3, 503.4, and 505.5 shall
be deleted.

- =159-



C. Section 506, Total Building Performance. Buildings less
than 10,000 square feet shall comply with Section 506 using a COMcheck Energy.
Analysis. Buildings 10,000 square feet or more shall comply with Section 506 using
Building Department Approved energy modeling software, including but not limited to
the most recent published version of the following: eQuest, Trace, Carrier HAP, or
EnergyPlus.

3. Climate Zone: Figure 303.1(9) in the 2009 IECC represents that
the city of Hailey is in climate zone 16, the most extreme climate zone in Idaho. Said
figure 303.1(9) shall supersede the climate zone for the city of Hailey referenced in the
2006 IRC Table N 1101.2 for all construction.

Q. Opening Protection. Section R309:1302.5 of the 2006 IRC shall be
amended by the deletion of Section 309.1 in its entirety and replaced with the following
language: :

R 309-1302.5.1 Opening protection. Openings from a private garage directly
into a room used for sleeping purposes shall not be permitted. Other openings between
the garage and the residence shall be equipped with either solid wood doors or solid or
honeycomb steel doors not less than 1 3/8-inches thick, or 20-minute fire rated doors.
Doors shall be self-closing and self-latching.

R: ™ Séparation’ Section R R369:2302.6 of the 2006 IRC shall be amended by
the deletion of Section 309.2 in its entirety and replaced with the following language:

R 369:2302.6 Separation required. The garage shall be separated from the
residence and its attic area by means of a minimum 5/8-inch Type X gypsum board
applied to the garage side of all walls and ceilings forming part of the separation. Where:
the separation is a floor/ceiling assembly, the structure supporting the separation shall
also be protected by not less than 5/8-inch Type X gypsum board or equivalent. Garages
located less than 3-feet from a dwelling unit on the same lot shall be protected with not
less than 5/8-inch Type X gypsum board applied to the interior side of exterior walls that
are within this area. Openings in these walls shall be regulated by Section R309.1. This
provision does not apply to garage walls that are perpendicular to the adjacent dwelling
wall unit.

S. Egﬁations. Section 1605.2.1 of the 2006 IBC is amended by deleting the
equations for coefficient £, and replacing the coefficient f; as follows:

f, = 0.70 for roof configurations that do not shed snow off the structure, and
£, = 0.42 for other roofs

T. Snow Loads. Exception 2 of Section 1605.3.1 of the 2006 IBC is
amended by deleting Exception 2 and replacing Exception 2 as follows:

-160-



2. Flat roof snow loads of 30 psf (1 44KN/m?) or less need not be
combined with seismic loads. Where flat roof snow loads exceed 30 psf (1.44kN/m”),
thirty five percent (35%) shall be combined with seismic loads.

U. Snow Loads. Exception 2 of Section 1605.3.2 of the 2606 IBC is
amended by deleting Exception 2 and replacing Exception 2 as follows:

3. Flat roof snow loads of 30 psf (1. 44KN/m?) or less need not be
combined with seismic loads. Where flat roof snow loads exceed 30 psf (1.44kN/m?),
thirty five percent 35%) shall be combined with seismic loads.

V. Snow Loads. Section 1608.92 of the 2066 IBC shall be amended to
designate the ground snow load, p, for Hailey as determined on a site specific (CS) basis-
to be 120 pstf.

Ww. Snow Loads. Section 1608 of the 2606 IBC is amended by the addition of
anew Subsection 1608.3, as follows:

1608.3 Flat roof snow loads. The snow load, prin 1b/ft%, on a roof with a slope
equal to or less than 5° shall be the greater of 100 psf or the value calculated using the
following formula: :

Ps=0.7C.Cilp,

X.  Seismic Weight. Section 1613 of the 2006 IBC is amended by the
- addition of new Subsection 1613.78, as follows:

1613.78 Effective seismic weight. The effective ‘seismic weight in Section 12.7.2
and Section 12.14.8.1 of the ASCE7-05 shall be amended as follows:

4. For all roofs regardless of roof slope 35% of the uniform des1gn snow load
shall be included in the effective seismic weight (W).

Section 3. Severability Clause. If any section, paragraph, sentence or provision
hereof or the application thereof to any particular circumstances shall ever be held invalid
or unenforceable, such holding shall not affect the remainder hereof, which shall continue
in full force and effect and applicable to all circumstances to which it may validly apply.

Section4.  Repealer Clause. All Ordinances or parts thereof in conﬂlct herewith are
hereby repealed and rescinded.

Section 5.  Effective Date. This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect after its
passage, approval and publication according to law.

PASSED AND ADOPTED BY THE HAILEY CITY COUNCIL and approved
by the Mayor this day of January, 2013.

-10 -

-161-



Fritz X. Héemmerle, Mayor
ATTEST:

Mary Cone, City Clerk

Publish: Idaho Mountain Express , 2012

-11 -

-162-



AGENDA ITEM SUMMARY.

{ >+
DATE: 12/63/2012 DEPARTMENT: PW/Grants DEPT. HEAD SIGNATURE: HD

SUBJECT:

Woodside Boulevard Reconstruction:
e Consideration of Substantial Completion

AUTHORITY: D ID Code 0O IAR O City Ordinance/Code
“(IFAPPLICABLE)

" BACKGROUND/SUMMARY OF ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED:

Action Item ~ Decision to approve or deny substantial compietion as of October 20, 2012

FISCAL IMPACT / PROJECT FINANCIAL ANALYSIS

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT BY OTHER AFFECTED CITY DEPARTMENTS: (IFAPPLICABLE)

X City Administrator L Library ] Benefits Committee
X City Attorney X Mayor ] Streets

] City Clerk | Planning X Treasurer

OJ Building U Police ]

X Engineer X Grants Administrator an

O Fire Dept. O P & Z Commission - il

RECOMMENDATION FROM APPLICABLE DEPARTMENT HEAD:

Motion to approve-or deny substantial completion as of October 20, 2012 for the Woodside Boulevard Project

'ACTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL:
Date

City Clerk

FOLLOW-UP: ,
*Ord./Res./Agrmt./Order Orlglna]s Record *Additional/Exceptional Originals to:

Copies (all info.): ~ Copies (AIS only)
Instrument # '

— 017

-163-



. Document 00625

Ctty of. Halley

2012 Woodside Boulevard Reconstructxon R .

Certiflcate of Substant:al Completlon

; aner: Cxtyof Hailey. _ : o :,Owner‘scontract No
Contréct CTDGII-C- 07 D'TFH61 114G~ 00001 B .; »;_Engmeers Pro;ect No 8311 020_ e

Octdb'ér 'Zéth} 2‘01:'2'4 ‘

' X Date ofSubstantlal Completlon e :

- ,Complatlon of the Preject or pomon ihereof destgnated above IB hereby daciared and ig aiso tha date® ©
“of commencement of. apphcable warrantles requ;red by the Contract Documents except -as statedi-. L

- betow

A [tentatwe] [deflmtrve] hst of ltems to be comp!eted or cerrected is attached hereto Thxs hst may nét:.o -
' be all-inclusive, and the failure to include any Jfermns on such list does not:alter the responstbllity of the "
4 .Contractor o compiete all Work in accordance with the Contract Documents e B

DAmended Hesponsnbmtles ao lZfNot Amended

L e s e NNEPWC RS :
Modzﬁed From EJCDC C-625 Cerﬁﬁcate ot SUbsmnﬁa! Cunmletlon
Lo R Pagelon R o

"'The responsxbxhtles between Owner .and - Contractor for secunty, operatlon, safety,”"f'-'f.a g
* maintenance, heat, utilities, insurance and warranties shal! be as prowded in’ the Gontract’;"'

;'.'Documents except as amended as follows '



City of Halley
2012 Woodside Boulsvard Reconstruction
Document 00825

The following documents are attachad to and made part of this Cartificate:

Substantial Completion hag been granted with the understanding

that the attached Punch-list will be completed prior to Final Completion

and acceptance.

This Certificate doas not constxtute an acceptance of Work not In accordance with the Contract
Documents nor Is it a release of Contractor's obhga‘cron to complete the Work in accordance with the
Contract Documeantis.

,;/ //A //2/ 2002

Exeuut % % Datd
- lz-lZ

Accepted by Contractor Date

‘Accepted by Owner ’ ~ Date

2010 ISPWC 08625
Modified From EJCDC C-625 Certificate of Substantial Corapletion

. Page2ef2

-2 22— 2—‘

-165-



AGENDA ITEM SUMMARY

DATE: 12/17/2012 DEPARTMENT: Admin DEPT. HEAD SIGNATURE: Becky Stokes

SUBJECT:

Woodside Boulevard Reconstruction:

- Approval of 6" Pay Request in the amount of $875,637.01 for October 2012 work completed. Previously
Council had approved this Pay Request #6 as “not to exceed $911,178.94;" the difference of $35,541.93 was
deducted because not all certifications had been delivered to Civil Science for this pay estimate.

BACKGROUND/SUMMARY OF ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED:

The Woodside Boulevard reconstruction Sixth pay request from the contractor, Knife River, has been
received. All items have been received and the payment has been reduced.

The amount of the pay request is $875,637.01. Of this amount, $644,524.08 is paid for with federal funds,
and includes a minor amount of earthwork, concrete, aggregates and asphalt, traffic control, and
construction coordination; $162,747.65 is city funds towards the pressure irrigation system, $13490.95 is
paid from the Capital Fund for round-a-bout (Development impact Fees), $10,070.95 for the final of the
ITD aspect of the traffic sighal and $18,435.70 is funded by the capital fund for work related to waste
water for manhole adjustments.

Documents encompassed by this Agenda Item include:
e SF270 — Request for Advance or Reimbursement (attached) ‘
o Contractor's Application for Payment No. 6 (attached, approved by Civil Science)
» Contractor and Civil Science detailed documentation submitted as backup to Contractor's
Application for Payment No. 6 (available for review at City Hall)
Elapsed Time and Work Status Statement (available for review at City Hall)
Certification of Prompt Subcontractor Payment (attached)
Treasurer's Reconciliation of Contractor Pay Estimate (attached)
Hailey Paid Invoice Report October 2012 (available for review at City Hall)
Treasurer's backup detail on city labor for October 2012 (available for review at City Hall)

All of the documents listed will be submitted to FHWA.

RECOMNENDATION FROM APPLICABLE DEPARTMENT HEAD:

Approve Pay Request.

ACTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL:

Date
City Clerk

FOLLOW-UP:
*Ord./Res./Agmt./Order Originals: *Additional/Exceptional Originals to:
Copies (all info.): Copies

-166-



REQUEST FOR ADVANCE

OMB APPROVAL NO.

0348-0004

PAGE OF

1] 2

PAGES

a. "X" one or both boxes

2. BASIS OF REQUEST

OR REIMBURSEMENT . [J ADVANCE [ REIMBURSE-
TYPE OF MENT ¥ CASH
PAYMENT b. "X" the applicable box
(See instructions on back) REQUESTED | [JFINAL  [Z PARTIAL [0 ACCRUAL

3. FEDERAL SPONSORING AGENCY AND ORGANIZATIONAL ELEMENT TO
WHICH THIS REPORT IS SUBMITTED

4. FEDERAL GRANT OR OTHER
IDENTIFYING NUMBER ASSIGNED
BY FEDERAL AGENCY

5. PARTIAL PAYMENT REQUEST
NUMBER FOR THIS REQUEST

FHWA DTFH61-11-G-00001 6

6. EMPLOYER IDENTIFICATION 7. RECIPIENT'S ACCOUNT NUMBER 8. PERIOD COVERED BY THIS REQUEST

NUMBER OR IDENTIFYING NUMBER FROM (month, day, year) TO (month, day, year)

82-6000201 ) 10/01/2012 10/31/2012
9. RECIPIENT ORGANIZATION 10. PAYEE (Where check is to be sent if different than item 9)
Name: CITY OF HAILEY Name:
Number Number
and Street: 115 MAIN STREET S, SUITE H and Strest:
City, State City, State
and ZIP Code: HAILEY. 1D 83333 and ZIP Code:
11, . COMPUTATION OF AMOUNT OF REIMBURSEMENTS/ADVANCES REQUESTED
e ®) (©
PROGRAMS/FUNCTIONS/ACTIVITIES g -
TOTAL

a. Total program (As of date}

outiays to date . $ 4,812,216.76 1% 3 $ 4,812,216.76
b. Less: Cumﬁlaﬁve program income 0.00 0.00
c. Net program outlays (Line a minus ]

by e 4,812,216.76 0.00 0.00| 4,812,216.76
d. Estimated net cash outlays for advance

eriod : 0.00 0.00
e. Total (Sumoflfnesc&‘d) 4’812’216'76 0.00 0.00 4:812;216-76
f. Non-Federal share of amount on line e 1!761’316-14 1,761 ,316-14
g. Federal share of amount on line e 3,050,900.63 3,050,900.63 '
h. Federal payments previously requested 2,406,376.55 2,406,376.55
i. Federal share now requested (Line .

minus line h) | (Hheg 644,524.08 0.00. 0.00 644,524.08
j- Advances required by

month, when requested 1st month 0.00

by  Federal  grantor

agency for use in making 2nd month - 0.00

prescheduied advances 3rd month 0.00
12. ALTERNATE COMPUTATION FOR ADVANCES ONLY
a. Estimated Federal cash outlays that will be made during period covered by the advance ¥
b. Less: Estimated balance of Federal cash on hand as of beginning of advance period
c. Amount requested (Line a minus line b) $ 0.00

AUTHORIZED FOR LOCAL REPRODUCTION (Confinued on Reverss)

-167~-

STANDARD FORM 270 (Rev. 7-87)

Prescribed by OMB Circulars A-102 and A-110



i3.

CERTIFICATION

| certify that to the best of my
knowledge and belief the data on the .
reverse are correct and that all outlays ]

were

grant conditions or other agreement
and that payment is due and has not
been previously requested.

SIGNATURE OR AUTHORIZED CERTIFYING OFFICIAL

%(/ Stoten

DATE REQUEST
SUBMITTED

December 17, 2012

made in accordance with the 1Bz GRBRINTED NAME AND THLE

Becky Stokes, City Treasurer

TELEPHONE (AREA
CODE, NUMBER,
EXTENSION)

208.788.4221 x28

This space for agency use

Item

Public reporting burden for this coliection of information is estimated to average 60 minutes per
response, including time for reviewing instructions, searching existing data sources, gathering and
maintaining the data needed, and completing and reviewing the collection of information. Send
comments regarding the burden estimate or any other aspect of this collection of information,
including suggestions for reducing this burden, to the Office of Management and Budget, Paperwork
Reduction Project (0348-0004), Washington, DC 20503.

PLEASE DO NOT RETURN YOUR COMPLETED FORM TO THE OFFICE OF MANAGEMENT -
AND BUDGET. SEND IT TO THE ADDRESS PROVIDED BY THE SPONSORING AGENCY.

INSTRUCTIONS

Please type or print legibly. Items 1, 3, 5, 8, 10, 11e, 11f, 119, 11i, 12 and 13 are self-explanatory, specific

instructions for other items are as follows:
Entry

ftem

Entry

2 Indicate whether request is prepared on cash or accrued

Note:

11

expenditure basis. All requests for advances shall be
prepared on a cash basis.

Enter the Federal grant number, or other identifying

“number assigned by the Federal sponsoring agency. If

the advance or reimbursement is for more than one grant
or other agreement, insert N/A; then, show the aggregate
amounts. On a separate sheet, list each grant or
agreement number and the Federal share of outlays
made against the grant or agreement.

Enter the employer identification number assigned by the
U.S. Internal Revenue Service, or the FICE (institution)
code if requested by the Federal agency.

This space is feserved for an account number or other
identifying number that may be assigned by the recipient.

Enter the month, day, and year for the beginning and
ending of the period covered in this request. If the request
is for an advance or for both an advance and
reimbursement, show the period that the advance will
cover. If the request is for reimbursement, show the
period for which the reimbursement is requested.

The Federal sponsoring agencies have the option of
requiring recipients to complete items 11 or 12, but not
both. ltem 12 should be used when only a minimum
amount of information is needed to make an advance and
outlay information contained in item 11 can be obtained in
a timely manner from other reports.

The purpose of the vertical columns (a), (b), and (c) is to
provide space for separate cost breakdowns when a
project has been planned and budgeted by program,
function, or

11a

11b

11d

activity. If additional columns are needed, use as many
additional, forms as needed and indicate page number in
space provided in upper right; however, the summary
totals of all programs, functions, or activities should be

shown in the "total" column on the first page.

Enter in "as of date,” the month, day, and year of the
ending of the accounting period to which this amount
applies. Enter program outlays to date (net of refunds,
rebates, and discounts), in the appropriate columns. For
requests prepared on a cash basis, outlays are the sum
of actual cash disbursements for goods and services,
the amount of indirect expenses charged, the value of in-
kind contributions applied, and the amount of cash
advances and payments made to subcontractors and
subrecipients. For requests prepared on an accrued
expenditure basis, outlays are the sum of the actual
cash -disbursements, the amount of indirect expenses
incurred, and the net increase (or decrease) in the
amounts owed by the recipient for goods and other
property received and for services performed by
employees, contracts, subgrantees and other payees.

Enter the cumulative cash income received to date, if
requests are prepared on a cash basis. For requests
prepared on an accrued expenditure basis, enter the
cumulative income earned to date. Under either basis,
enter only the amount applicable to program income that
was required to be used for the project or program by
the terms of the grant or other agreement.

Only when making requests for advance payments,
enter the total estimated amount of cash outlays that will
be made during the period covered by the advance.

13 Complete the certification before submitting this request.

-168-

STANDARD FORM 270 (Rev. 7-87) Back



THd 51500 apISPOOMTU 150D 3PISPOOM\LSINDIY WITY\PAIE 3pIsPoom(elauely OT\:W

WV STi82T02/0T/TT

00°E88$-

0v'Zra‘es

.nz?‘zn WHOLE .m.—zmi:c 209 zo_m_>_n

AMHJlorseczs . |oozor 56528643 ofeer - |0o0s ' SLE95'28S. 5105288 58'028 11| sewo'e ssonp Aete o] 1B YO0L
- s oo TR - OTUTH e L] s
IVLIdVD|s8'8es: los't} STOv8'ES 05'8vT 000§ N € 7 |oe zon'es - 06'528 41 | b el 6o5) qing elosou0D WD puEs) AUeD Iogepuncy| Vvl
VLIV |9r 188z or'8et 62°915'L1$ 09°'v80'T 000, o Jsveseiozs G 26€'02$ SLo1$ a1 | eoz's (ie10Q Ueld 205} 211D B QD [EAROA UBUG PRRPUBIS|  G'V'LP'O0L
AME {0008 - 06'ZL6°E$ 00'9vT 00°0$ 06'2L6°E$ au.wS.na, L {srers s a1 oFe (1190 VBl 895} 1BUND § QIND [BAI1BA Youl-g prIpueISt GV 1 PH0L
AMHJ|sresTs ov'TY 0F°152'6% 09'429 - 00°0$ A STSZY6S - G262h'68 1 lorplg’ EE 6£9 | {v102-QS} 2UnQ ONQIND [23oA SjqeINOfy Uou-8| PV L1 90L
IV LIdYD[067L0E°T$ 0699 IETVCTS or's8 SeZEES - 0oLt 08'6V0ES" " |oe-ebo'es %8501 S581$ 1| o5 (Ieoq] Ueid 695) J2IND ON QNG [EWPA YO £V 1'V'90L
AMHA [0003 - ST'166'7S 00'eST 00'05 - = ST'T66'2¢ 51°166'2$ R ] Cd1)oest {tewq verd 805) sanng o ainD ieanioA walie| £V L'Y'90L
AMH3 {08895+ foo'zv} 02'888'83 002Ys 000$ o0-doz'as oba1é ‘-] oo (1eq veid o,m..w, 1519 3 Qing pajoy 96p3 paueyaL woure] BV EY'O0L '
05'Z€9! 00'5S 000 j K 0008 R b . (1076 ] orprares
TvLdYD i ? . L * 05zeo% g N 5. | veig eog) 91IND 3 G0N0 POIoY MOL DSIUASH P PILPURS YIULE rvitreal
ol'avs'LT 08'575' 0E' 182652 ozovs’er 00°0% - Tooreza'szzs Toshes o : URIOaE ey gy
AMHA ¢ i : i 00°920°0128 Nedlddd I jeore el 205) 224D § N PO 0 OSISNON  PILPUDIS i Fviveor
zrves- {eo'tn) 29'980°22 1988 000§ " OB LE lozz0s - s 190] 855 BIBJING BAEI0OBAI ML gy -y
VLYY ¥ m B . ¢ B 4 Ncn 18 cN. 198 >,w 1e :u:.é |Sd 000€ SSEID - USLISAE B1BI0Y WWBILSY) PUBIOY EVIVs0L
1956t eEl s0T6L, '98E - ey - - B TREMmBAIp e1eAia] O S
AMHAd |To'ses'z$ T Z6LLT$ 508 c0d5T 6§ - : 295 5 00U 551D - WoleAE ole2otiog Wi PULIod ZVivsoL
AMH|ovazs- {010} [iT4:13 443 018’ 000§ 00'p028 ’ (reweq vetd sig) dwey ojokojg paamp 8asid uj1sen elewod) TV HYEOL
. " A13H0NOD 1 002 NOISIAG .
vLLzs'ees 21°985°082% 08'€82'¢ 00°0564
000! i B 00'852°S: 00Tt 00°956! - DU ey 209
A jooos $ : a6 1 a1y 3 01RiD ‘ouB4 5[ IO DISUId YIS UISEE HDIRD
VLI YD [0000s'ss 00'E 00'009'23 00y 000§ ) (#219q uBlg 205) 1NouS ¢ @IeID ‘owes 1Y) 'Y odk) UISEE AN ¢H'1r'209
AMH3 008 B 00002968 00°LE 00 00'009'Z8. V3 | 28 | (mio0 veid eos) 1nous 3 oiei ‘oo v odhy wseayawo] & HYE00
IV LidYD [ooass’ss e 00'0$ B - : ¥ 00°098'+$ ¢ » (1190 Ui 95) o119 ' oumad 1oy | edk | uiseg yowo] | L'V 'P200
AMH4jo00$ N - 00075655 00CE 0002’53 00°025'65$ : 00'008'}$ e {1190 Ui 095) 01010 § B 1oy '| odAg wisug wated| b HYZ0D
V1IdvD|eoces’es 00T oovos - - 0008525 ¢ 000852 - va ) (10 Wi 0as) S1eI00D UG UG O uBIg wis| TV 1P'Z09
AMH 0008 - 000v0'TZS 00’8 00'089°28 va 8 | tr19a wsid ons) 01010100 vi your-ap viauuesy wesq uriors| - TV1Y209
AMH o008 - 00'069'2$ 00'€T 00°060'E vi | ‘ez (19150 uetd s05) wiq your-bz slonuapy upeia vnois|  VYHEE0S
" - 0o" o R = — Tddo) L
65~ N Cdul Ly
AMHA 009 s - oo wv oooos'ss oS 00 wvm : Q:w . OHAU] YOS sopaxg D "edid Uiei( WIS HRUL-g! ey s
4jooos B 00°0z9'8 1 00°56 59818 - ¥ j : : 148001 gg'v') 109
AMH i . 00°904$ A | 58| sdpars pen 9 ‘PN UEK] WIS 0,00
s - - — S (¥ 5] EPYYIE
000002 00'0F 000 . - BLV'LF109
Amrd i ¥ - : 00°00Z8 41 1. 0L | edig pais pozuenen E&E_Ou HaAINg UpIQ UHOIS | 5X.89
22€’ 2 E0b - DN g= i TadorewapoAd] g1 'y'1'p 109
IV LIdVDjorzeets 09'eS ve'eor'0t$ ab'90y oa'ses | oer v oo o poieiniD 'sdd U g I Z] VI'E
000 - 07'BBL SE! 00'86€'7 9628 7 | gee 1ddoT et 8I'VIFI09
AMHA o008 $ 09'62$ RELE: 2 o210 oAU KoUPIY PaIEBIIOD "odid U] WIOIS yaurgL
06'86T! 009z 000 R o 1 an &d5 VY109
IWLHAYD S 2 $ ) j 59°L$ A1} 920 |- opon yoows sopeia paeBnid ‘adid welg W0l YauZe
{4 |es 01T oSt 896559 05'LS! T | 1ddS ! LUVEY109
AMHA $ 65'9% 5298 (2] sopiuy Eaa...w otong pojEBniog ‘edid UIO [ N—_
00E 19! 000t 00°0: WSO 24w 1y 109
. A4 > s odig s pozynED POIEBLIOD BNND UDIG LIS - OE,
SLUBTET 00'SE ST'90E"Y WSSO 4 yv)p' 109
AMHY $ $ an 1e91s poziuENED) pajabnuod A wei .Ea.w ..u:. 0F
" NOILYORY!

YILYM[o00s T oS ra'ryior
ULV [ooEsss- “lovzeves : 008-0 OAd .0 - edid Vel RIEM|  1'V LY Loy
R . TFLYM - 00 Nolsind -
Joo'sasss. 00°'9€E'Z

>>>I..__oc,=o-.$ . 00z 00°98€°2$ ooy co0s 00'vess uoijeABaxXg EEEc_&xm, 1'O' b e0E

] ) T e DNIHONIML % 008 NOISIAD ’

L1'SSE'ESS €2'05£'06E$ S.mg.nw 06°G0L°607$ .
AMHA [Lovbs'ers 95'ST6'T £6'S00°T$ yoe8 0’03 : 6' 8.%@.9% %880} | 59914 AS |'ooo'e a_n%z 10ds 1jos) uojiearox3 feuale ajqepnsun|  VE'SY'E0E
AMH: [ovos ’ - 00°000'8E24 001 5005 oc.%o..u,mmm ] %.pcc.snue: %9°61 * 00°000'8€2$ s1 ] waunjuequ3 g uoeaeoxg|  LY1E0e
AMHA 000 - 00'952¢$ [ 009523 8.2,&. ) %019 009523 - S youag Bunsixa sjedoRy|  0'41 V10T
- AMH [00'ses oot oooees oo 0008 - 0026L8 ; 00'99% va | 21 | twononiisuog so) Armioduse ) xom yew Bupsixa esooy vy
L AMH4[oo'sor'ss 00’8y 00'2€8'L$ 00z’ 000 00 0bZPES 00°958% v3 oy T eQuourg <- eal) Buisig jo(eaoway| CEYI0E
AMH [000$ - STHObS oa'tt 0005 m‘w.ruvw‘ wn.mnm. w3 | i - Bg yoje) Bupspg Jojeroway|  HAHY102
AMH|oo'0$ - 058085 00'5¢ 000§ - am,.m%w 0L'e2s 4 |Tse ) 118A Bueray Bugisis jo jeaowayf  £'F1'¥110C
AMH 059524~ foogLt} 00'6€S VS 00°890'T 00'0$ ] om...mn nhﬂa E ST BN B Qg ejaiouoy Hupsix3 Jo jeaotay)  'FLY'I02
AMHos'sees 00017 SLPERS 00'sLT 0008 SZTYL‘IS 50'e$ adjd Ui wwoig Bujisix3 jo jeaotuay FIVEI0e
AMH|vEsoT'TS vs'vee 9T'6IE'SY Flaiiay 79'614 v : no.\.@m.mu, 0968 apasouo) Buysix3 jo jeaoutey|  S°ATHYI0Z
- AMHA[szotv'zs-  [vorbss’) Sb*(65°083 ...o..umm_«w. 9L'v68 NM [H3-r24 084 asejing shouumyg Jo [eaoway|  1'A'VV102
AMH|00'03% . - 09°€£5'515. 233 000§ 27 |ooosg'tg ) .wo tjout-g > (EAOWSY 831 B m:_n_a_.:w Am:_.qa_o 1'veyioe
s oH ; ", SHOMELEVE © 002 NOISIAI *
1s0D IINAIAHOS n__m m_m<m
150 siin w0 om0 | 1OVHINOD  SH3IQHO yenuoy | 4d10% | § [tnn] © NOILINOS3a "ON WaLl
ONINIVINZY IINVIVE 129f0ud TVLOL 9153 Aed 0€/0T ANIHHND JONYHD rewmbuQ IMAS
Z10Z/1E101 3Lva NOILONYLISNODIY GHYAIIN0G FAISACOM  *1D3r0Ud

-169-



THd $I150D BPISPOOMT Y $IS0D 2PISPOOM\LSINDIY BINIFY\PAIG Bpispoomteueuty OT\:IN ) WY ST:82102/01/2T

ov'osg'zE 88'£88°L53
SrTreTs eoegr - |erebers
I N ¢
6Z'TE2'99%.

SESEEGHIS

001091 6§

80°0Z8'01 ma.mnn.az»

oc gL' Fps

11'295'185 e
YILYM|ISLTI6ES ™. %m.wﬂv,
YILVM [SSELEITS
HILVM

%0765E
(i:|%siee
%608

a o, . Buppog| VO'V¥I00k
) " Bupees| L VVI00L
PV Ly 2001

L 4OSs
e neess,

osdo

1v'98VZT

[earieetozs
0002275
" oc.w"o.mmm

YILYM
YILYM
YILYM
HILYM [ooerLT$”
HALYM 001018
¥alvmjooos
yatvmiooog -
HILYM[000§
HILY 008628
¥ALYM
YILYM

€'V'1'H 608
Teviveos

,am,m $eiB10g1 .__§ 9Ad - 69insas o
!, 5Ma uojeByi) amnssald ‘ed ub| . T'V'L V208

S * eAjep uolebiy) einssald Bi0 .9 1YL EE08
7 puag ;08 X .8 - Sulll Ulew UoieBlL anssald) b1 @) v 108
EVE VY108
. eVEV Y08
LAV 106

oL'E'H Y 106

| ©mO[3UF UM baEuun«!u:«u-m 68 L'V 108
sais pianpetiJn i .9 - Burisg o vonBisiy ainesosg :

00'T9E'YS . m_z_nsnmn_m.mﬁ._, w.<._.v.ncm

cO'ERLTS T | 00%E ]
00'b08'Z§ | oo
-|oorates L oo
:Joo'g06s 00t
oo'bbls | 00,
oooey'ts 7 oos

00bsts |00t
ooosTzs | 0T

003 -

RETCZ 002815 o8 1106

UILYM 0008 ) LEVY108

EICZ 00'€T8S 2'a'L''108 1
H3LYm|c il 00EITS Tediyios m
YILYM - "+ Joosves VE' Y08 —
HILVM[00091zS :loogTes €108

YILYM |00'bTZS- Y 100'040'TS [ AR !
UILYM 8..om Hoowte'ts - Joo9” gLy 108

¥ILVM[ereszs 86796045 < - om.mmm.m. B ZV11068

Y3LYM]ovtevs: “Isoses’ses | oo6as’y” R ..A ne : 1.9] Ivibi0s

._.< _~E_ 3Ynssand

2008 zo_m_>_n

VG'EEe LS 1ZeLb'vBl'ES [1o'9cs'ag 13°580'r 018 05°219'¥E SL'TSI'TIE

| S2°260'FIE 1S .Eos:m

AMAH | FOS0E'FS- : feesel s preesIs ” ] .mu.ﬁnm.w.. nma“mﬁe‘..m. mm,m«nw m».mw,o.mw_mm. . a mN,,pmo.-mm.—w. $m-- . movhmm. SE wam&nguaﬁr.zn I S5€)D " _c._EgsmaL_rn_n_.ﬂ_—onw EVivols,
IV LidyD|o8'sso'ovs 00'VSTE 00'0$ e 000§ ; 08'550°0V5 om..m.m.c‘.nvw : %LLE . 0448 : R mN B5-Dd YIS Il 55010 ._Esgﬁx_s_.a_m gl bvivole
AMH2|ov62s's6s 00TZSL " - OBGETYSS | 00'b0LTY 60'809'9LES™ - | BY'YSY'6L: - - forola'zeds; 02°028'269 %6 - oels T B 92-85-9d Wit 'l S590 Wowoned XN g VLY OLS
AMH 858985 fzss) - {ssweees | £o9st R ES Jeoosss: Joogeses L0 Juevee | Cloesis oL ve | oor ?m:%mcozﬁuxx;:aﬁéE___w_._smvga_a vaLyens
ToLidvO|prrTse’ty- (boae) © T Jbsep'ors ¢ | porese v . oottt 00'b8L'YLS ni . %S00k 00712 .- .- redAiTyour-g eseg 10 eeBaiBby pausial 2V Lv208
‘ AMH:d[ooos o : 00°'9Ta'E0ZS 00'969% - | ~Joosto’sozs 00°919'£028, %00k . |00Les * )i 2dA1"youj-z eseg Joj ajeBaifiby pausniol  Z'V'1'h208
Iv1lldy2|ooos ] - 00'69¢'63 00'LYE oosge’ss . fooure "7 S.mmm..mm‘u. o0B9E'8s | |oesis | |oozes 1adk1Tyourpyg aseq Jo) 51eBaIBBY paysUD| 'YL b'E08
AMHZjo00s . - T toorest'gars 00'8ZT'9 L nm.vaw.ww.. § ESObT ; 00'95T'89TS oo..wm—.ww_.w %8614 00728 " _.un._.ﬂ.l—_u ig aseg Joj ajebaibby va;w:.o _'.<,_.?Nom

AMHA|egszsbs-- - flszeen) £'SLLTLS seeerz oo B 00°052'89% %gs0r ! |ogeed

VYEyioe

98'ETV'ELS 7802588 srerezals %,u%_— om.mam.mm& | 0£°005°556$
AMHd[oozess . oot 1 oars'zs s fooos N N A T WL | THryseL
AMH: 0008 e jovzivers . oot . Joorbzo’ris 00ZIT'ITS : 00'2Li'01S P L LUPHLE0L
AMH4 joo'szes- {oo't} 00'SLETIS 00T, 00°052'8$ 00055 11§ 00°055' LIS - .GNE.nm.um..aag_:&sm_m_sma._&?aimm uepsepad FHYI0L

AMHd 0050823~ (ooe} . 00°095€95 8.2.. 00'S6T' Ty 8.mmmdmm. ; 00'656'09%" . 3 C«E..ow. ﬂ:.aa m.__:._uz, miq_um_...n_i dusty uonsapod| | VHLP90L
AMHA 95289 - ey vores'ss [ LTIRY EETI 00°2E9'9TS 128 ) OVY90L
T R R W o00TTS | TR Amo:.omu ﬁaamiggﬁa_snso TF L'r'90L
WidVD|sresrs {00'E) s ST'8b9'9% B oo'Eet | - jooos IR y : ] N 7o Citaen os_sw»%sume Lo ‘SIS Doy .Nm; tm.o»
AMH4 |66°s2€E"9TS- .mmumﬁ : 60°66L'68ES 68’ mmu T Nm.mmm..mq.m. . B.wk.ma, - o_.,m;ﬂm,.w, B o lovery'sies 58'1e8 ’ {602-a8) womL Youpg "swemepis dlaition|  1'E1Y'90L

. 1503 sun 150 syon | DDVEINGD.  SH3AHO j9e1U0D $ 1NN| © NOILdI¥DS3A *ON WALt

DNINIVINZY 3NV TvE 3{0id y10L 9153 Aed 0E/0T INSHEND - IDNVHD (eUISHO Imdst

- - 210zZ/1eiol 3lvad NOILONYLSNOOTY QUVAIINOE JAISAOOM  LO3roMd




TUd 5150D 2pISPOOMTYd $1S0D Q_u_m—uoag/._..mm_)_gwx ms__mx/ﬁzm U_U_m_uQO\S/_m_u:m:_k Oﬂ/u_\c

WV sT:82T02/0T/TT

99'856'297$

ve'0z0'es 09°g12'508 | " |ITEL 00'6L6'0L25 * 00°626'042%
AMHA [be'ort'ss 8L's8 99°b15'e$ TTH9E 0004 E 00'859°9b% " 00'858°0v$ %0001, 00°E01$ 4| esv. (1 199)-€ #2BUN [I2AA %0018 Aine10) s Bueiayy]  002E-dS
AME4 [000L6'TS- {00’} 000EL'LY$ 006 00°0EL LY$" 006 00'0925T$ %.oﬁ.m—w %e'9zt. 0002816 v3 8 WA Xog B RSNID 0oie-ds
AMH [o00$ - * [ooove'ses 008 go'ovT'EEs - T | 00°E ' 00°049'08% " %g'90 ) 00°080°) 1.8 v3 K] Jowpys sng 0DDE-dIS
VTR w50 OIS @0 reeeTs %00 = - . .x.nme oc.mwa.m_w. FSH JuawaBeuz}y eld UopuaA3Id volniod Jalep uo)s|  9122-dS
AMRA[0005 - 00'000°c0TS 60T 00 06EETS - P 00'G00°E015 - 7y . Emnw usag PUBIST - geye-ds

wzo_m_>omn_ |_<_umnm

00°9£5'2123

00§}

Izolang

zi0z/1e/01

00°759'0% 00815189
uItvmfoozezss 00’8 00'V8S TS 00'9L 00'706'5T$ * loo'958°€e 2 loo'rees. ol : ape1 o] Isnipy ‘X0@ aBAf  1°0’} 0602
AWHA 0008 E “Toozov'es ) 0aaTzs o Z0veE - 06 1058 muE@o_ﬁiE\ 4 g ompnng 1o wais|  1er1bocoz !
Y : 007557€§ 00'zs 00'307'61$ ¥ apesp oy snlpy ‘ajouueny] * v 1 ¥oeod —
AMEH {0003 - 00'000'551$ [R3 EA uopuziqon| 1v'i'v'0i0Z =~
g q o5 NOANYTI30SIM £ 000 NOISIAIG —
' 5.°181'59% 51'968'726¢  [90°892'07 50'262'828 oy 05'BLUEAES 05°821'98E'S :|sjorqng ] 1
AMH j00'v89$ 009 00°9tb° VS 00'6E 00'292'e§ 00°EE 00'0ET'S$ oo'0e'ss N0’V ‘va | &b 1s0d pue s 1psa|  1'FYS01 L
AMH4|oooes'ts 00's 00°0EL°LTS 00'sk co.w-m.mm cooonm-m g Jweaey 00'yBE$ va - .cw. sisod ubig ea1s| 201 S0
TVLIdVDjooecr's oa'sty 0008 T 0005 00'ELT'TY %0001 oz 0l a5 | e Bupbis wauewiod| 1’1k 5011
AMH4 |orestes © | o0Tiz . 0008 - 0003 e.&w-d - 0v'2gLes %0'00} - a5 | eie Bujubig wouvuued| 1V 1'¥G0L
IVLIdYD|006TT$ 00'87 5T'LZ0'TS 00°'LLY 8.%. mn‘ww-.,wm.. : G Z . 5 ) naw.%:s wur U] auE MOIIBA u_hu_naos.mm}ssﬂ_wl__ Ly RN A1)
WLdVD [ozetes 0072 006615 000V - 0008 0TZ6LT$ AL oew opunon 035) apipn Yoo o8P oA u__mu_?.ﬂ““o» sErrIoLl
WLIYD [6Ebss- (o€'2) vZ'08Z'ES 0E'0bY a1 | eev Bw. o ——— o=m..mﬁa=mm.: vu____x.z vyl
LIdYD |sees o) seasas v .. ‘w,_,. 173 ’ £35) SPIAM YoUI-ZL auN epla AR .Sﬂcﬂum sabyiol
VLIV [osorzs 005z SI6153 ) 41 | 98" | yourge wpm ipurzieun opw poicg powpon] 28 VYIOH
IV Ldvo oosezs 0002 09'€ST'v§ 00°2sE" ER R R " shupjiep wowonng opeonious | '@k 10
AMHd[sTT0z'ss 05'650° Sweals om.o@.,. . L T sOuppeiy Wewened FI99S[ SV LYVOI
AMH4joroze'zs 00TETHT 09'66v'1$ 0By E .._u.__.a“m _”.___.,u " sotrenee polied 0 JEd Y _E_._”.ﬁB VIRl
AMB [orTeets oobIEr 09'V0L3 00'950'L oww.c.w .h«.ﬁv.ﬂ.i.a:.%%ﬁ 4 P 0 W ._._.:S_nw Hw eVEVIoN
 AMHd [orzets 00’858 0003 B S e _Shﬁh EVIEIOLE
AMH4 [oz zoe’ss 00'8TT ov'9zL'8TS . 00992 x T HW yoe L Bouetiajjely [O1UH0D agpeil| Vrypeolt
AMH[sTrTe’ses 00'sSS SL69V'SS 00's8 00 b8 1" 1 6§ " T siabej:f jonuog vipeIL| ~ LTHYE0NE
AMH:l0T'60L°E$ 00°182 08'8LLY 0065 v ¢ - o swiniq jaipo oygeiy | . 1@y yEot
AMHA [ovzozs 0’8 o1°'9¢65 00'28” e.m.mm_.—w B v sapeouteg auod oljjfell}  1'0'LYE0i}
AMH:) |61°v565 SL8t 90°ZLY'LS STELY'T < |szozr'Bs | . : subjs juon oerl | L'E'LYE0L
AMH [000% - 00°006'6$ - 00'F : S T jonuod ayjely uoosued] 1Y YE0l |
AMH4los'szge - [(ooz) 00°¥YROTS O00E6'Z g R 0% s "ond Wped 2 1| eI
AMHA |oross- {00'8) 00'95b'61% 00'0zZ1’s 09'5Zb'6T8: i 0b o8 ‘OAd ‘INpuod 2| +'3°1'¥'Z011
alljooos € - 00020212, 00°7 - 00109 Sm <00 000207128 000262128 feubig oyl 1'VII0L)
00FE NOISIMG : o )
50 sun 1500 1IVHINGD SHIAUO joenuUOD NOILd1¥OS3a ‘ON W3l
DNINIVAZYE IONVTVE afoid L1 9153 Aed 0€/0T INZWHND  ADNVHD reuiBuQ oImds
Fiva NOILLONYISNOO3Y QUvAZINO0E 3AISAOOM 11.03royud




T¥d 5150 3PISPOOMTYd SI50D BPISPOOM\LSANDIY BWIZH\PAIS BPISPooM\jeURUIL 0T\ NV 5T:82102/01/2T

¥8'162°L29 0v'bT6'0E 08'bS6'6L8'E OL'SEV'ST Q0'ZE9's8 :
) vo'LvE'agy S9'LbL'T9T
v8'162°LLS ST'80200Z 00'61F' 102 $6'0£0°0T
09'600' 09429t < - MM eresg'szt ’ £9'858°6¢
OT'ETT'TTT | 886roT . .-431VM| eoos'0s0’e 80°v2S'bb9
00°109°0T {ooTos'or = 0,._,,_ +123dse Jad 946 s59) %ﬂ
' TTTTY'TOT | s6'sse’s o VYD o~
T8'9Y6°L8E | TrEisoot © o AMHA —
FONVYIVE 39VNIVIIY 1
MM 00Z8EY 69'€80'€TY 00'285'2E S6T91 390’y 00'904'61 oT'EZLTLE
: YILVM TEELV'S T5°L66'26 ZEETETLL . ’
au - 0002021 00°109°0%
IWLIdYD LT'ss8’vs B0'6T1'SET ) SY'956'TY
AMHA orELeze VE'VLY'TIZ'E ov'avb'sso S
69'€80'S2VS = 56'291'¥80'v$ __ 96'ZEL'B0F 91°622'1268 v9'9bZ'205'b$

SO'VBR‘ZET'YS
65'29¢€'122$ B o

303 sun 1503 sin | 1OVYINGD - SHIAHO joeUOD 4410 % $ iINN] © NOLLdIMOs3a "ON WaLl
DNINIVIAZY 3INYIVE 13ford V101 9153 Aegd 0£/0T ANZ¥NND IONYHD leutbuo IMdsI

ZL0Z/LEI0L +3Lva NOILONMISNOOZY GHVAIINOG 30ISGOOM  1.03rodd




ey T T VYTV T=T"Y

PROJECT: __ WOODSIDE BOULEVARD RECONSTRUCTION PAY REQUEST #6 5w - -
{CLIENT: CITY OF HAILEY 10R072012 g% 28 58
FHWA PROS NO __ 1DGILC-07 DTFHE1-11-G-00001 E E % % g g 3 5 E Iy
LS.P.W.C ITEM DESCRIPTION AUTH. | | UNIT 2 2 e % S e SE &g
QUANTITY PRICE | = = ° = 22 ez eE
NO. = el - ol S0 =3 =2
BASE BID SCHEDULE z g z S 2° 8 S
<] S <] ]
= OWISION 730 - EARTRWORK
2014341  |Cesnng Gnisbing & Tece Remavs) < G-mah O 827 AC $1.680.00] 509 9.27) $15.570.600 _ 515573.60|  $15.573.50) 199.00%:
2014101 Remow! of Brtuminows Surtace. 00,144 SY $2,804.78| €1.008.04) $80,507.45| $80.507 45 $78.187 20 403 0A%Y
201.41.02 |Remowt of Exsung Concrete 1,816 sY 515,02 1.491.45] $5.360.26) $6.537.60 82.13%)
2014181 Remowe! of Exsting Storm Drain Pine 385 1F $0.00} 27500 $£38.75| $1.174.25] 71.43%)
20141E2  |Removal of Existing Concrete Crrd § Guer 890 LF 50.00]  1.088.00] 54,539,00) 53.782.50| 120.50%5
2014163 Removel of Exrsbng Retaining Wall as LF 50,001 5808, $808.50| 109 0%
2014 151 |Removel of Exanng Coteh Bosin 1 €A 50.00] 5404.25] s0a2s] ot
2014153 Romoval of Exsung T ree - > G-inch Dia. 40 Ea 50,00 $7.832 00 57.832.00) $14.240.00) 55.00°
20141F.4  |Reicale Exshng Mail Box (1 amporary for Comstruction) 12 EA $0.00] 5720.00] $720.00) $702.00 av_mﬂ_
201 41.F.6 Retocate Exsnng Banch 1 EA 5250.00} 5256.00! 5256.00} $250.00] 100,00
2024141 |Excaveion8 | s 50,00 $235.00000(  5208.000.00]  $238.000.00) 193 01%
2024583 |Unsuitnble Maienal Excavalion (S0 Spot Ropait) 3.000 SY 000! $1.405.93 $1.405.03]  $40.850.00] 2.8
$3,108.40! $3508,350.73 $2356,250.73] $409.705.00 56&53|
B - DIVISION 300 - TRENCHING - * : | i R g RS R . i
3034381 |Exlormtory Excavelion L £A $584.00] $0.00| 4,00 $2.330.00, £52.338.00/ $3.504.00) 23 673
Subtotal:; $0.00| $2.330,00| $2.326.00 $3,504.00 68.67%
DIVISION400 ~WATER - '« . *. I IR R T B R B i
A01.4.1A 1 Wpler Main Pipa - 6 PYC C-000 18 LF 58830} 4 $0.00| 28.00; 52.472.49| $2.472.40 $1.585.40| 155.60%,
401.4.1.8.4 waler Msin Fiiting - 127 X 6" Tapoing Sleeaws with Tappina Veive 1 E& $4.170.00) 50.00| 1,00} $4,170.00| $4.170.00 $4,170.00 1090 0%
Subtotal: 30,00 $8,842.40| $8,842.40 $5.756.40 T15.2%|
DIVISION 000 - CULVERYS, STORM ORAINS, AND Y - : cL R A R I - I -
801.4.1A.19  130-inch Storm Drain Cuivort. Comuated Gaivanized Steel Pipo (CGSP) 100 LF $60.25, . 50,00} 65.00} 54,300.25| $4,300.25] $0,625.00| 65.00%]
30-inch Stom: Dram Cuivent, Cormucated Gahvanized Steel Pioe (CGSP) 10 LF 501.30} C 50,00 0.00) $0.00] $0.00 $013.00;
B801.4.1.A17 12-inch Storm Drain Pipe, Corrucated Extarior Smoath kanor Polyathyiene (Perforated CPP) 898 LF 57.85] o $0.00] 857.60] $0.550.88 36.550.83| $6.882.70
601.4.3.A18 12-nch Storm Drain Pipe, Cormugated Extenor Smoolh Intenor Polyotrylene (CPP} 1.858 LF $25.00| $0.00| 1.804.40] $46.192.64| $46,192.04| $47.504.80)
001.4.4.A19 (067551 Storm Drain Gdwrt, Corugaled Gelvanized Steef Pipe (CGSP) 10 LF 5200.00 $0.00] 0.00} 50,00} 50,00} $2.600.00!
60°x4C” Storm Drwin Cuivart, Cornusaled Gelvaruzed Sicel Fipe (CESP) 95 LF $190.00) 50,00| 05.00] $1B.620.00| $18.620.00, $18.620.00}
B-inch Stonm Drain Pipe, Cormupaled Extenor Smooth interior Polyetilene {CPP} Ja4 LF $36.00( "~ - $0.00] 350.00| 55.600.00| $5.000.001 $5.504.00!
00244435 | Storm Drain Manhole 24-inch Dia. (Seo Plan Dotall) 2 EA 51,030.00} . 50,00} 23.00] 523,600.00}
0802.4.1.A2 Storm Drasin Manhole 48~nch Dsu, Concreto (See Pian Datail} 9 E4 $2.630.00 £0.00] 8.00; $21,040.00{ $21.040 00/ $23.670.001
002.4.1F 1 | Cateh Banin Type |, Injet Frame & Gralo (See Plan Detail) 25 EA $1.880.00[ N $0.00] 32.00| 550,520.00) $§59.520.00; $05.100.00,
002 4. 2 Ceten 8asini T ype Ul inlot Frame. Gruie & Snout (Soo Plan Delait) 41 £A $2,600.00) . 50 00! 38.00] S568.800.00] $68.800.00| $100.600.00
002.41F.3 Cateh Basin 8-inch Plastic Yard inlel, Frame, Grate & Moe Fittings. 11 £A $478.00| “2.00] $050.00] 14.00] 55.258.00! $5.258 00| $5258.00
$280,586.77| $280,586.77! $312,114.50/
R R B . DMISION e : -
703.4.9A2 Concrate_Cost in Placa Curbed Bievele Ramp (See Pinn Detail) L 8,10} $2.138.40|
7054.1.A2 |Portiand Coment Conctete Pavamen - Class 3000 PSI_S-inch Thick (privaie drivewny) 502 SY 851" _J; 388,08} $17.702.09| $17.792.09]
7054143 |Portiund Cement Concrate Pavemen - Ginss 3000 PSI_Buinch Thick {Docorniive Suraco See Detail) 3 sy ] 32807 s22088.02  $22.080.02)
700.4.1.A.1 3einch Standard & Reverse Flow Rolied Curb & Gutter (See Plan Delall) 24127 LF $0.00) 22.540.20] 5250,261.30, $259.281.30|
700.4.1A2 3ainch Thickened Edoe Rotled Curd § Guner (See Plan Detail) 500 $0.00} 542,00}
706.4.1.A3__ |G-inch Vorucat Cum_No Gutter {See Plan Detaill) 3% sa2.35|  242.10)
706,344 __{G-loch Hountalie Venical Surb_No Gutter (SC-701A1 R : R 2760,
706.4.1.A5 Standard 6-inch Verucol Curb & Guuier (See Plon Detail) 1,508 $21,489.18]
706.4.1.A6 _|Roundabout Gentel bstend Comers Concrate Curb (See Pian Detall} 147 5000 148.50] s:!,ubg#; 5384815,
706.4.4.8.1 Concrete Valiey Gusters | 3,075 5000  2.673.00] $70,825.05] $79.525.05/
706.4.1.E.4 | Concreie Sioewslks, S<nch Thick (SD-708] 11.726 $43,608.52] 12.238.59)] $389,799.09| $389.799.09! $373.473.10|
7004.1.E2 Conctele Sidewalks, Snch Thick (Decomtive Sutface See Pian Detail) 120 $0.00} 123.00| 56.,648.15] $6.848.15 30.480.00
706.4.1.F.1 Concrele Driveway Approsch (SD-7108} 4 +1.00] 1,420,004 4.00| $5.880.00| $5.680.00| $5.680.00] 100.02°
700.4.1.G.1 Remove, Stocksile snd Reast Exisung Brick Paver Driveway . 126 ©100.50]  $14,465.88] 121.17] $15.094.44] $15.004.44| $16.632.00) 95,47
208.4.1.1.1 Pedestnan Ramp wiDetecizble Waming Domes (SD-212F) 73 i, 17,00 $14,105.00) 76,00} $03.460.00! $03,460.00| $60.955,00) 102319
705.4.1.H.3 | Pedestnan Ramp whstociabie Waming Domes (SD-712G) 14 “40.00} S!.Zwﬂ 15.00) $12.375.00] $12.375.00] $11,550.00| 107.16¢
Pedestnan Ramp wiDaloctable Waming Domes (S0-712A) 19 EA $843.00/ - **13.00|  511,024.00; 19.00} $16,112.00] $16.112.00| $18,112.00! 10415
Pedostnan Ramp wibeteciable W orming Domes (SD-712C) 4 [ $892.000 2>l $0.00 3.0} sz07000] _ s2078.00(  $3.588.00 75!
Subiotal: $102,043.78| $842,082.44 $942.082.44| $055.508.30

* -, DIVISION 800 ~AGGREGATES AND ASPHAL"

801.21.A3 | 3-inch Minca Uncrushed Agarapste (W oshed Drain Rack) 229025 starses|  sr2mised|  ses2s0.00) +09.93%))

oY
802.4.1.A1  |Crushad Agorepale tor Base Jid-inch_Type | 9575 oY . 587.501  S15,863.31) ©.576.00]  $177.52500] $177.525.00] $177.525.00) momﬁ
8024.1.A2 _ {Crushed Agavegate for Base 2-inch_Typa Il . 10,400 (24 i 5000 10.478.64|  S220.051.44] 322005144  $218.40000 100,70
806.4.1.8.1 i for Tack Goal (0.08/GALSY) 300 GAL 9284 $141730]  156.77) $2.398.58] 52398.58] $4.530.00!
810.4.0.A.1  |2" Fiort Mix Pavement, Ciass U, 344 PG-568-28 53380 sy 20854,98) $370.508.09| 42.704.00]  S5¢234080] 55424080 $677.026.00
810.41A3 |2 177 Piert Mox Pavernent. Class I, /4° (Driveways See Pian Detail) 4535 sY L:Z12055] $100.790.38| 4.570.25|  S160.3z7.78)  $169.327.76) $168.021.75

$494,585.17/

£1,184.410.21) $1184.41821[ $1.311.852.75

- DIVISION 200 - PRESSURE IRRIGATION -

so0|  4.889.00] 575.525.05]  S75.535.05| 57504085

2014342 |6 Dis, Preasure imigation Pipe - PVC 4857 i3
9014142 |2 Dio. Prossure Imgation Pipe - PVC 5508 \F $0.00| 548350  §70.40208)  ST0.62068]  $70.752.10
601.4.18.5 | Prossure inigotion Main Eitting - 0 x 45° Bend S EA sa1800, - - 50.00 8.00 $1.314.00) 51314.00) $1314.00
014182 |Piosoure i in Fiting - 6 x 22 1/2° Bond ¢ EA $234.00] 1 $0.00 5.00) $1.070.00] $1.070.00) $856.00
014,183 |Pressurs Imostion Main Fitting - 8" x 11 1/4* Berdd 1 EA $210.00 50.00) 1.09) $216.00) 5216.00} 52370.00
£01.4.1.84 | Prevaura imigation Moin Fiting - & x 0" x 6" % 6 Cross 1 EA sue00| - * 50.00 1.00 5348.00 $345.00)
§01.43.65 | Pressure rigmtion Main Fittng - 0 x 4° Reducer. 1 €A $479.00 : $0.00 1,001 $179.00 $178.00
501.4.1.8.0 __|Pressurc imgaton Main Fitting - 6° Cop 3 B A 50.00 2.00) 551300 $513.00
2014187 Pressue frriaotion hsin Fating - 4" x 11 1/4° Bend 1 EA 5185.00] [ £0.00 0.00} $0.00] $0.00!
©01.6.488 | Presawrs iication Main Fitbng - 4° x 22 112" Bend 1 Ex $187.00{ - $0.00 1.00 $187.00 $187.00
£01.4.1.89 Pressure knation Main Fitling - 0° Dismater Redused Presswa Backliow Assembly With Enclosure 1 EA $7.250.00 0.10] $726.00) 1,00 $7.250.00 $7.250.00]
£01.4.9.8.10 __ |Pressure [maton Main Fitting - 4* Cap s EA 518400 . $0.00) 1.00 $154.00 $154.00
$05.4.1.8.41 | Pressure imgation Mein Fitung « Manual Droin Vahe and Assemby 4 Eh saos00f - $0.00 5.001 $1.400.00) $1.490.00)
£01.4.1812 | Pressure miation Main Fituna - 4° x 4° Bend 4 EA 5180.00] " $0.00 4.00) $744.00] $5744.00
00+.4,1.8.13 Presaure Imigation Main Fifting - 6 x 07 x 6" Toe . 1 EA 3$408.00 N $0.00 1.00] $408.00 $408.00;
901.4.1.8.14 | Prassine rmoation Main Fithng - 6 x 90° Bend 1 Eh $310.00 30.00 1.00| $318.00 $316.00) $310.00
024,143 6" Do, Pressure imaation Vaive 3 EA $701.00] $0.00| 4,00} $2,804.00| $2.804.00] $2,103.00
0024142 |¢ Cia, Preasuro imoation Vaive (4 EA $581.00 N $0.00 3.00) $1,743.00) $1.743.001 $9.488.00
903.4.1A1 1~ Dia. Pressure krigotion Pipa Sesvice - PVC with Fibarpiaas Box © 14 E4 5623.00] $0.00} 7.00! $4.361.00] $4.361.00} $8.722.00
9034142 |1 17" Din. Pressure ¥riaauon Pios Service - PYC with Fiberpiavs Box 42 EA $067.00 600 $4.002.00) 4800]  s3201600|  $32.010.00] 52803400
903.4.143 |1~ Combination Air RelesselVacuum Valve Station 2 EA 51.410.00) 50.00 2.00) 52.2200 52.220.00! 5222000
+ Subtotal: $4,727.00 $203.331.03]  §203.331.03] 320895575
 BEST. {BMPs) B . . - ;
10074348 | Topsoiling (6} 17.208 sY $530] 10030450  $56.341.39] 12.400.47 50023120 501.202.40
1007.418.1 _ {Seeding 12573 SY $138| - 50 00) 0.0 $0.00) $16973.55
1007.41.C1 |Sodding 4900 sy $840] 183.030  s1s4240|  183.03 $1.542.49) $1.54249]  $41.180.00)
Subtotst:| $57.883.88 se7.77378| _ serTrazel 514033585 4538%
R ' . DIVISION 1100 « TRAFFIC

=173~



PROJECT: __ WOODSIDE BOULEVARD RECONSTRUCTION i PAY REQUEST #6 5w 5 =
CLIENT: CITY OF HAILEY 103012012 gx a8 58
FHW & PROJ. NO _TDGI-G-07. OTFH01-11-5-00001 " o E E % g"; § ; ;E % E
15.P.W. AUTH. o r S = &
1.8.P.W. CVI'TEM DESCRIPTION auantiy| YNT| price £ £ 2 é 5‘ ’"o-’ e g ..2 E
BASE BID SCHEDULE E 8 2 8 e° 8 8
o 13] <] o
110Y.4.1.A.1 1 mtfic Sipna! 1 LS 5212.020.00} 0.05, $10,601,00| $212.020.0C} $212.020.00| $212.020.00}
1102.4.1E.1 7" Condue. PYC, Sch. 40 5112 LF 52,60 $10.456,00 519.450.00| $16.425.00;
1102.4.1.E2 1 12" Condutt, PVC. Sch. 40 2923 iF $3.70] $10.841.00| $10.841.00| $10.815.10)
1103.4.0.A.1 Comtrucvon T ratfic Contro! ‘ 1 LS SQ‘&W4W 0.2 58.000.00) $0,600.00] 59.900.00|
1100.4.1.8.1 Trafhe Control Signs. 1.605 SF $5.25| .230.00) S"IM 57.472.08] $8.420.25)
110.41C.1__| Troffic Cantiol Bormeados a5 A 525.30 5036 10 $030.10 su:ml
11034101 | Trathc Comsel Drums, 340 A $13.20 $178.60 sr2as0]  ss486.00]
1103.4.1.L1 Teatiic Controt Flagoars. | 840 L) 564,35 17.00] $1,003.05| B5.00] 55.460.75] $5.460.75| Sdt.‘lbiﬂ[
1103.4.4.0.1 Tmbiic Control 0384 Ll 570.40] .50.25| 53,537.00| 200.00] 518,726.40] $18,726.40] $22,033.60)
1104.4.1.A.2 P ino Paint or Painied ingrs, 4-inch White 558 LF 50.30] - $0,00] 0.00] 50.00f $0.00| $107.40)
1104.4.1A3 Pavoment Line Paint o Pamied Povernant Markings, 4«neh Yallow 20260 LF « $0.10] , $0.00|  7.040.00] $704.60| S$704,60)| $2,020.00
1104.4.1A4 Puyemant Line Paint o Painted Pavement Markings, B-inch Wihite 21.830 LF $0.20] 50.00| 7.408.00| $1.400.60] $1,400.00)| $4220.00
1104.4.1.A.5 Special Pavement Matkings 3,530 SF $1.70| S0.00| 470.50) S700.85| 570065 $6.001.00)
1104,4.1.8.9 Pavemant Markings 372 ‘| §F 511,80 S0.00] 352.00) $4.163.00] $4.153 60| $4.280.60)
1104.4.18.2 Modified Thennoplastic Dotted Wide Line_12-Inch Wide, 30-inch Lang, 36-inch Gaps <} LF $9.25| 2 50.00| ©1.00] $819.25| 3618.75 $680.25
11D4.4.1.83 Modified i ine_12-nch W Datalt) 76 1F $0.250 5 -~ 50.00] 71.00] $056.75| S056.75) 5$847,50) 1 43%]
1104.4.1.8.4 Madilied Thenmoplastic Yellow Edge Line_8-inch Wida (Sev Roundabout Detnif) 433 LF $7.45 50.00| 240.30] $3.280.24| $2.280.24 $3.225.85 1, ﬁ
1104.4.1.85 Thermoglosiic Y/hite Edga Line_4«inch Wido {Sea Datall) 412 LF 54.25| 20.00| 40,00 51.470.00| $1,470.00] $1.702.20| b2.5
1104.4.4.86 Thwrmoplastic Double Yellow Luna Line_é-inch Wide {Soe Dataity 505 LF $4.25| L 50,00 A477.00; $2.027.25| $2.027.25| $2.140.25 1. nﬂ
1105.4.1.A.0 Permunent Signing 327 SF 5120 - % 50.00| 0,00} $0.00| $0.00 $3335.40 0.00°
1105.4.1.02 Slec) Sign Posts. 50 E4 $304.00) 14,00] 554,510.00) 45.00| $17,730.00] 5(7.730,02‘ $19,700.00] ﬂqﬁ
1105.4.1.E.3  |Resot Sign £nd Post 45 Eb 5114.00) 2a3.00]  52.702.00| 39.00} $4,440.00} $4,448.00] $5.130.00) ao,n:'-xﬂ
Subiolal:| $28,202.05| $322,906.75] $322,900.75) $388,178.50 B!.Zl'gl
Bl 23 "~ DIVISION 2000 < MISCELLANEOUS - ¥ " PR B - T ol R - -
2010.4.1.A.1 $155,000.00, 50,04 1.00] $155,000.00f $155.000.00| $155.000.00)
2030.4.1.A.1 Manhole, Adpst to Grade - 59 EA £620.00) 31.00| $10.406.00/ 52,00} 532,552.00] 532,552.00, 536.934.00) &3.14%
2000 8.1 Stom WaisrStnxtce, Diy Weil. Adiust 10 Grade . 5 EA S507.04] - 4.00] $2.268.00 6.00] 53,4024 $3.402.00| $3.402.00| A00.00%
C.a Valvo Boz, Adjust 1o Grade " 84 EA $284.00, =58.00f $15.004.001 76.00] 521.684.00] $21.,584.00| $23.850.00) .48
Subtatal $37,578.00] $212,538.00] $212.53B.00| $210,182.00 06.98Y
i . <2 SPECIAL PROVISIONS - f.oi2% R S| K IR P i 5 5 Sl
S§P.2130 ic i Scheduling. Phaging. Staging & Sleking sm.owgg 0.13] $13,390.00| 1.00| $103.00000f  S103.000.00| sw:mou.oﬂ llHl_m#
S5P-2210 Stom’ lion Plan $10.620.00] -.  *0.08] $1,353.60 0.45] $10.074.00) 510.074.00 $16.420.00) 05.00%]
SP-3000 Bua Shalter $11,080.00 3.00| $33.240.00) 8.00] 588.840.00| 588.640.00| lw.ﬁlj_’:l
SP-3100 Clusler Mail Box Unit $1.870.00| :/7D.00)| $17,730.00] 8.00] $17,730.00| 517,730.00| 515,760.00) 112.50%;
SP-3200 Rchmrﬁwmb (Grmvity Block Wall Undar 3-feot Tall} - $0.00] 3064.22] $37.514 60| $37,614.60] $40,052.00) 80.40%;
$85,713.00] $202,858.80| 5202,058.60| $270,870.00 87.04%;
“CHANGE ORDERS L) E :

$0.00

co1 Siralght thod (Spo! o Cost)

CO2 Halk-fnch HMA i : Changa for Bid kast 810.4.1:A'3; No Conl): % Y i 2 $0.00p57 04

cm Concralo Stab Size Adjiatment troms Approved Plan (Uv:reas0s.Bid femi 706.4.1.E:1) eF1EE2) : 5955, 5884.78%

co¢ Remove Bit kem 601.41:A:4900"51" Storm Druin Cutvor, ¥~ - 7 & g (e : %5 -52000.00 i

£0s Add Faved Drivewny ot 165430 Ri. {incranaes Bid ham 810.4:1:A:3-112" HMA Pavement) 2 5247.12)

co8 Changs Pisn Call-Out Stations for, Removal of Bruminous Surinca on Shost C-502 -$43.88

= Cutiuri Rétfowe! (Aidtions! Work) AT : ¥ sogo| _ 16000] . - ..5737.60) s7a7.00]  -52090.80 -35.18

co8 brigation System (Addiionst Work) Ky b 3. ] a0 3 482 50219844 000  $i036801| $183.066.31)  $201.735.74 06.00%

[ et + g ik : 3 50.00) 0.00 5000 50.00 51.828.00) 0.00
cow ‘Additiond Conctete Spec Changes - 7 A S0.006262%

co Olterate Stiping {Additionn! Work). = $5.25000) 1.00) 5$5.250.00] $5.250.00 $5.250.00 AR,
coiz Fiakd Fit Cutvens (Addtions! Work) $0.00) 1.00) $1.134.81 $1.134.81 $1134.81 10000
cO13 Lowt Monboles (Additional Work) % 50.00) 2,00} $2.020.80) 52.020.80] $4368.00) 60.00
co $608.50 2.00) $808.50} $808.50} $1212.75| 6047
CO15A 3000]  165.75) $1.435.81 51.435.81) 51533.20! 4!
cotss avaiion {¥ ) '~ 1 70 $4530.500

cO16 Chanod Gonerete Spec ~ % 3 S0.00{%

con instalt Slote 5175 3.00 st7a.26] $173.25} 317325 100.00%:
_coms Conc: : fionol Wik} s " PR 100" $157.50) 2.00 s315.00] 531500 $315.00 109,005
cotn Additions! i Bid kams, To Be Paid Vie Overrun of Unit Bid kems} . = i ' % $20300.00

con dditone! Homs; To Bo Pald Via Ovarmun of Uril Bid hems) S A e i % 53.780.00 z
coz1 Cancreta Coloting &+ - L 5 5 5450000 4.00 v $4.500.00] sa.50000] 450000

GO s s Drivevny balerial, ToBo Pai id foma] -+ - /51,531 20187 7 Z ; 5153120

coz Retatning Wall {iocreass Bid koms, To Be'Paid Vid Ovormun ot Unit Bid iems) $$103.00] 7 St i $15.038.00 /%

con  Addiional Stopo Work (Additional Work} ¢ 3 5 : 522.605:40] 1100 |  s22.505.10) 1.00)  se2sos10]  s22505.10]  $22505.10 190.09%
co25 Sod 2 Landscapo Qty; To' -516:805.10 o Z o s 515586510 FZA
€O Foundation Pad (Additional Work]'s; : 344400 50.00] 0.0 50.00) 50.00| $3.996.00 0.00°

co27 | Adddtional-Tima (No Cosl Change) < - & ~:50.00} 7 e % S0.00

c028 Pavor.Sieps (Addilional V/ork) - g B -$75.00) . 5000 0.00] 30,00} 50.00 $500.00

G2 Drivewny Strips {increnses Bid. kems, To B Pald Via Overrun of Unl Bid Homs} - DA Z ’ $1,607.25!

o . B Tl s e

5128,077.29) $233,47.48] _ 5233,147.18]

3021,723.10]

PAY REQUEST #6 TOTAL
5% RETAINAGE OF TOTA| 540.086.18 520420815 S225302.33

. TOTAL ELIGIBLE FOR PAYMENT THIS ESTMATE: [___swsoara0 |

34,084,102.05] 34,507.240.03

~174-



wsusked 10f Uogyeapddy £ Jo1520U03 029-D IAI13 41103) PRUIPOW

0T300 2SI OT0T

2/ ~L-2]

@il

i im saurproade U) 5 WA kEg 0] uopEddy syt £g paan3 > I
Aunoos Suap gans Aue jsupSe SUnO SuyGumsapug ;Mg 01 jqridsaac puag © £q patanca afe St yE0S 1d2a%3))|
SINIGUITAND PUE SIS9.910] PINIVS “EHAT |8 30 SS9 PR sog psusdad Jo sum ju Rung o ssed-fun juawfg

‘10§ woneaddy sitg £q PAIIADS 10 L) ORI SSUAIAYI0 0 PO PIES g patesodionut uandinba pum sje{sIE AI0AY
(e 30opn () oonede 203 suonealtddy Jolid £q patanod Yiop it LEK2 a paumaug suonedijqe ayumiiiag
50PNl 3Treyasip o) unodss ue patldde uooq ATy IPERU0Y) AR RPUT JUP X0/ JO IURORT UO JAUMNQ Wi0Y)

1 spsitfed ssasBord d [z (1) o Bpajmowy 51 JO 155q ) O TSI S3YTH33 S0jaAu)) PASiisiopin ML

o : SITRS £ o ue))

S TIENLIS 02 AH EDONVHD 19N

BCERTSHR STSIYBLES STV10L

SNOLLONGIA sNowaav

(Gia) (orqeondde 51) Sously Rupung
g * :4q paroxidy
(oreq) (umo)
i£q pasosdde 51
(Junoure Jz10 a3 3o uoruedys Yot ..:..:.e 30 8 oY)
- s yoiwawksy
@) (PaqSug)
217 <771 14q POpUANILI0304 §)
(unoase 13410 21 jo sonmdys Yame - PR 10 g SNlf)
Y0'LE9'SL8S s Jo wewkeg

SEISTLTIS ¢ ~o{adnnney 4. pr10ig P pARIdmo)) K10y - I P JLETTT )]
AOYNIVLTY ST ‘HSINIA OL IONYIVE 6

T0ZE95LES § NOILYOr1ddV SIFEL 30d INOWY 8
EEEIETETs T (mopeayddy sopd oy 9 aury) SLNWAYL SNOIATYL SSHT L
ORPSSGLEES & e —(ag 3urg ~p dury) ALVA OL FTAIDI T INNOWY 5
ST30TH0IS § (g sury + w5 our) adwuimag IO >
8008 § T ERdIsy pRIOIS 0008 X %o1'q
STR0THITS 5 ~rpeRidwo) oA S6791'480'VS X usT®
{FOYNIVITY 5

SETITPROFS  § e (RIS, 10 Bnie) ,Id 01 1503 wERue) FI0L,,)
4LVd OL a3¥0LS ANV I XAIIN0D TVIOL F

G Dl
EIEVLLS S
SUFSBLETIS S

Jmoudeg 103 voninudy

501-Zloz voN wafaid saeandug #10920¢ 10N 120001 501703103 [10000-D-1 [-19HALA HLo-D-TIDAAL 10N 1EAU0) SIMQ
; Seg] g
ZI0T/6E — BONINNSU0NY Pread|aod apispeop ———
aouriugy (sorzenuo)) PR IO
WWPS D A ey ~ uopmiodio) Rang U winrg ) ! ! oy,
ponad
woncvijddy
OLI00 WARMNO(
wapan 4 pIEavineg 0pISPOOM Z10T

Aayeh jo Aud

-175-



ITD 2832 (Rev. 3-10) Certification of Payment
itd.idsho.gov Idaho Transportation Department

Fill out for each estimate/invoice and return within thirty (30) calendar days of receipt of ITD payment.
Ref; XTD Std. Spec. 109.05 (Construction Contracts) and ITD Consultant Agreement Spec. 1.5 (Consultant Agreements).

Use additional pages if needed.

Key Number Project Numbar Project Name
Woodside Blvd Reconstruction

Work Reflscted in ITD Estimate/involce Number

Contract/Agreement Number

TDGH-C-07; DTFHE1-11-G-00001 ‘ Pay App# ___5

List any subcontractors/subconsultants or manufacturersfsuppliers not paid for work reflected on pay
estimatesfinvoices for month being reported. Payment must he made for satisfactory performance based on the
contract/agreement between the contractor/Consultant and the State. Retainage must also be paid upon satisfactory
performance completion based on the contract/agreement between the Contractor/Consultant and the State.

Agreement Administrator/

- Subcontractor/Subconsulfant _ Amount of Resident Engineer
Maqﬂ’éctu rer andior Supplier Reason for Non-Payment Non-Payment Approval/Disapproval

A

L (Sm ﬁﬁ’y)&@ | ,%ﬂzﬁj&ﬂ/ﬁm%ﬁ% 5

Name (Pnnted or Typed) ‘ Title
of ml'a&., LLL . '
. Contractor/Consultant

do cemfy that to the best of my knowledge and with the exception of those subcontractors/subconsultants or
manufactures/supphers listed above, all subcontractors/subconsultants or manufactires/suppliers have been paid in accordance

with the contract (20 days after receiving p:?znﬁior the work performed by the subcontractors/subconsultants or

manufacmre su lers), and that any retainége hell on a subcontractor/subconsultant or manufacture/supplier’s work has been
released W1 in ays after satisfactory completioh of all of the subcontractors/su’oconsultants ar manufactures/suppliers’ worl.

Gontx%bé jltant‘s Sigr7'€\ 74_/ Date
) 4 4aA . / r;L / 7 / O LA,

175 Distab lon PrOJect Fne )
Page of

-176-



